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ADDENDA CONFIRMATION

Addendum #1
Confirmed May 7, 2024 5:45 PM by Al McClaran

Addendum #2
Confirmed May 7, 2024 5:45 PM by Al McClaran

Addendum #3
Confirmed May 7, 2024 5:45 PM by Al McClaran

QUESTIONNAIRE

1. VENDOR/CONTRACTOR INFORMATION*
Pass

Please Provide the following Information:

. Respondent/Vendor Contractor Name

. Vendor/Contractor FEIN

. Vendor/Contractor's Authorized Representative Name and Title
. Address

. Phone Number

A U~ W

. Email Address

1. Southern Disaster Recovery, LLC

2.45-5312400
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3, Al McClaran / CEO

4. 93 Sonia Dr. Greer, SC 29650
5. 864-469-9776

6. al@gosdr.com

2. Provide a twenty-four (24) hour phone number and email address in the event of emergency*
Pass

It is hereby made a part of this Invitation for Bid that before, during and after a public emergency, disaster, hurricane, flood, or other
acts of God that Hernando County shall require a “first priority” basis for goods and services.

It is vital and imperative that the majority of citizens are protected from any emergency situation which threatens public health and
safety, as determined by the County.

Vendor/Contractor agrees to rent/sell/lease all goods and services to the County or other governmental entities as opposed to a
private citizen, on a first priority basis. The County expects to pay contractual prices for all products or services required during an
emergency situation.

Vendor/Contractor shall furnish a twenty-four (24) hour phone number and email address in the event of such an emergency.
Chip Patterson / Vice President of Operations

904-334-9690

chip@gosdr.com

3. VENDOR/CONTRACTOR CERTIFICATION REGARDING SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES*
Pass

Section 287.135 (Current Edition), Florida Statutes, prohibits agencies from contracting with companies for goods or services of
$1,000,000.00 or more, that are on either the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized Companies with
Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector Lists which are created pursuant tos. 215.473 F.S. (Current Edition), or the Scrutinized
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Companies that Boycott Israel List, crated pursuant to s. 215.4725 F.S. (Current Edition), or companies that are engaged in a boycott
of Israel or companies engaged in business operations in Cuba or Syria.

As the person authorized to submit bids on behalf of respondent, | hereby certify that the company identified above in the section
entitled “Respondent Vendor Name” is not listed on either the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List or the Scrutinized
Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List, or the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List. | further
certify that the company is not engaged in a boycott of Israel. | understand that pursuant to section 287.135 (Current Edition), Florida
Statutes, the submission of a false certification may subject company to civil penalties, attorney’s fees, and/or costs and does not have
business operations in Cuba or Syria.

Confirmed

4. VENDOR/CONTRACTOR SURVEY*
Pass

Please provide information on where you received the knowledge of the bid/request for proposals (mark all that apply):

OpenGov Procurement

5. VENDOR/CONTRACTOR SURVEY (OTHER)
If you answered "Referred" or "Other" in the Survey, please specify:

No response submitted

6. Please confirm bid validity for 90 days *
Pass
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Bids will be opened immediately after this date and time and will remain binding upon the Bidder for a period of ninety (90) days
thereafter.

Confirmed

7. List of Facilities *
Pass

Please provide a List of facilities available to do work.

Company_Profile_Additional.Offices.docx

8. Personnel List *
Pass

Please provide a List of personnel, by name and title, contemplated to perform the work.

Key Personnel - Hernando_Co. FL 05.13.2024.pdf

9. BID CONFIRMATION*
Pass

The undersigned Bidder has carefully read the Invitation to Bid and its provisions, terms and conditions covering the labor and
equipment as called for, and fully understands the requirements and conditions. Bidder certifies that this bid for the same
goods/services (unless otherwise specifically noted) and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. Bidder agrees to be
bound by all the terms and conditions of this Invitation to Bid and certifies that the person(s) signing this bid is (are) authorized to bind
the Bidder. Bidder agrees that if awarded this invitation to bid, Bidder will provide the labor and equipment as stipulated in the
specifications of this Invitation to Bid. Bidder further agrees to furnish and to deliver labor and equipment as indicated, with all
transportation charges prepaid, and for the prices quoted.

**IMPORTANT NOTE: When submitting your bid, do not attach any forms which may contain terms and conditions that conflict with
those listed in the County's bid documents. Inclusion of additional terms and conditions such as those which may be on your

[SOUTHERN DISASTER RECOVERY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Invitation to Bid - Disaster and Debris Removal Services
Page 5



[SOUTHERN DISASTER RECOVERY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
T No. 24-TFO0708/AP
Disaster and Debris Removal Services

company's standard forms shall result in your bid being declared non-responsive as these changes will be considered a counteroffer to
the County's bid solicitation.

Confirmed

10. Drug Free Workplace Certification *
Pass

| have read and attest to, in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087, hereby certify that,

Publishes a written statement notifying that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession or use of a controlled
substance is prohibited in the workplace named above, and specifying actions that will be taken against violations of such prohibition.

Informs employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the firm’s policy of maintaining a drug free working
environment, and available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that may be
imposed upon employees for drug use violations.

Gives each employee engaged in providing commodities or contractual services that are under proposal a copy of the statement
specified above.

Notifies the employees that as a condition of working on the commodities or contractual services that are under proposal, the
employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the employer of any conviction of, pleas of guilty or nolo contendere
to, any violation of Chapter 893, or of any controlled substance law of the State of Florida or the United States, for a violation
occurring in the workplace, no later than five (5) days after such conviction, and requires employees to sign copies of such written
statement to acknowledge their receipt.

Imposes a sanction on, or requires the satisfactory participation in, a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program, if such is
available in the employee’s community, by any employee who is so convicted.

Makes a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug free workplace through the implementation of the Drug Free Workplace
Program.
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“As a person authorized to sign this statement, | certify that the above named business, firm or corporation complies fully with the
requirements set forth herein”.

Please Confirm that you have read and attest to Download Drug Free Workplace Certificate

Confirmed

11. Affidavit of Non Collusion and of Non-Interest of Hernando County Employees*
Pass

Affidavit of Non Collusion and of Non-Interest of Hernando County Employees

Certification that Vendor/Contractor affirms that the bid/proposal presented to the Owner is made freely, and without any secret
agreement to commit a fraudulent, deceitful, unlawful or wrongful act of collusion.

| have read and attest that | am the Vendor/Contractor in the above bid/proposal, that the only person or persons interested in said
proposal are named therein; that no officer, employee or agent of the Hernando County Board of County Commissioners (BOCC) or of
any other Vendor/Contractor is interested in said bid/proposal; and that affiant makes the above bid/proposal with no past or present
collusion with any other person, firm or corporation.

Please confirm that you have read and attest to Affidavit of Non Collusion and of Non-Interest of Hernando County Employees

Confirmed

12. Sworn Statement

SWORN STATEMENT SECTION 287.133 (3) (A)*
Pass

| have read and attest that | understand that a "public entity crime" as defined in Paragraph 287.133 (1)(g), Florida Statutes, means a
violation of any public entity or with an agency or political subdivision of any other state or of the United States, including, but not
limited to, any proposal or contract for goods or services to be provided to any public entity or an agency or political subdivision of
any other state or of the United States and involving antitrust, fraud, theft, bribery, collusion, racketeering, conspiracy, or material
misrepresentation.

[SOUTHERN DISASTER RECOVERY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Invitation to Bid - Disaster and Debris Removal Services
Page 7



[SOUTHERN DISASTER RECOVERY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
T No. 24-TFO0708/AP
Disaster and Debris Removal Services

| have read and attest that | understand that "convicted" or "conviction" as defined in Paragraph 287.133 (1)(b), Florida Statutes,
means a finding of guilt or a conviction of a public entity crime, with or without an adjudication of guilt, in any Federal or State trial
court of record relating to charges brought by indictment or information after July 1, 1989, as a result of a jury verdict, non-jury trial,
or entry of a plea of guilty or nolo contendere.

| have read and attest that | understand that an "affiliate" as defined in Paragraph 287.133 (1)(a), Florida Statutes, means:
A. A predecessor or successor of a person convicted of a public entity crime; or

B. An entity under the control of any natural person who is active in the management of the entity and who has been convicted
of a public entity crime. The term "affiliate" includes those officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees,
members, and agents who are active in the management of an affiliate. The ownership by one (1) person of shares
constituting a controlling interest in another person, or a pooling of equipment or income among persons when not for fair
market value under an arm's length agreement, shall be a prima facie case that one (1) person controls another person. A
person who knowingly enters into a joint venture with a person who has been convicted of a public entity crime in Florida
during the preceding thirty-six (36) months shall be considered an affiliate.

| have read and attest that | understand that a "person" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(e), Florida Statutes, means any natural
person or entity organized under the laws of any state or of the United States with the legal power to enter into a binding contract
and which proposals or applies to proposal on contracts for the provisions of goods or services let by a public entity, or which
otherwise transacts or applies to transact business with a public entity. The term "person" includes those officers, directors,
executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, and agents who are active in management of an entity.

| have read and attest that based on information and belief, the statement which | have confirmed below is true in relation to the
entity submitting this sworn statement:

[attach a copy of the final order].

| UNDERSTAND THAT THE SUBMISSION OF THIS FORM TO THE CONTRACTING OFFICER FOR THE PUBLIC ENTITY IDENTIFIED IN
PARAGRAPH ONE (1) ABOVE IS FOR THAT PUBLIC ENTITY ONLY AND, THAT THIS FORM IS VALID THROUGH DECEMBER 31, OF THE
CALENDAR YEAR IN WHICH IT IS FILED. | ALSO UNDERSTAND THAT I AM REQUIRED TO INFORM THE PUBLIC ENTITY PRIOR TO
ENTERING INTO A CONTRACT.
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Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any of its officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees,
members, or agents who are active in the management of the entity, nor any affiliate of the entity has been charged with and
convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

IF YOU CHOOSE OPTION 3, PLEASE ATTACH A COPY OF THE FINAL ORDER

The entity submitting this sworn statement, or one (1) or more of its officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders,
employees, members, or agents who are active in the management of the entity, or an affiliate of the entity has been charged with
and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989. However, there has been a subsequent proceeding before a Hearing
Officer of the State of Florida, Division of Administrative Hearings and the Final Order entered by the Hearing Officer determined that
it was not in the public interest to place the entity submitting this sworn statement on the convicted Vendor/Contractor list

Please attach a copy of the final order

No response submitted

13. Authorized Signatures/Negotiators
Authorized Signatures/Negotiators

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURES/NEGOTIATORS *
Pass

Please provide the information to support the statement below:

The Vendor/Contractor represents that the following persons are authorized to sign and/or negotiate contracts and related
documents to which the Vendor/Contractor will be duly bound:

Name(s)

Title(s)
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Phone no (s)

1. Al McClaran

CEO

864-561-7797

2. Chip Patterson

Vice President of Operations

904-334-9690

TYPE OF ORGANIZATION *
Pass

Select your organization's type below

Corporation

COMPANY ID*
Pass

Please Provide Your:

State of Incorporation and
Federal I.D. NO.
South Carolina FEIN: 45-5312400

W-9 FORM *
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Pass

Please attach your completed W-9 Form
W-9_SDR_- 2024.pdf

ACH ELECTRONIC PAYMENT *

Pass

An ACH electronic payment method is offered as an alternative to a payment by physical check.

Please check Option 1 if you accept the ACH electronic payment method.

(Recommended and Preferred)

Yes, ACH electronic payment method is acceptable.

COPY OF FLORIDA DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS ANNUAL REPORT
Pass

Please upload a copy of your Florida Division of Corporations Annual Report
Annual_Report_FL 4.3.2024.pdf

Florida_Certificate_of Existence_- 2024.pdf

E-VERIFY CERTIFICATION*

Pass

Vendor/Contractor acknowledges and agrees to the following:
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Vendor/Contractor shall utilize the U.S. Department of Homeland Security’s E-Verify system, in accordance with the terms governing
use of the system, to confirm the employment eligibility of:

All persons employed by the Vendor/Contractor during the term of the Contract to perform employment duties within Florida; and

All persons, including subcontractors, assigned by the Vendor/Contractor to perform work pursuant to the Contract with the
department.

Confirmed

14. QUALIFICATION SUBMITTAL REQUIREMENTS
REFERENCES*
Pass

Bidder must provide a minimum of three (3)references in format shown below. References must be individuals that can be readily
contacted and have first-hand knowledge of the Bidder’s performance on the specific project performed by the Bidder. Each
reference project must meet the following criteria:

Project within the last three (3) years.

Similar in size, dollar value and scope as this project.

Please provide information for 3 required References:
Business/Owner Name

Reference Contact Person

Reference Address

Reference Phone No.

Reference Email Address
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Project Name

Project Location

Contract Project Manager

Site Superintendent

Contract Amount

Date Project Commenced

Date of Substantial Completion
Date of Final Completion

Description of Work Performed

By submitting this information, | certify that the qualifications questionnaire information is true and correct to the best of my
knowledge.

|_References.Customers.xlsx
EQUIPMENT LISTING *
Pass

Bidders shall indicate below a complete listing of all equipment said Bidders will use in the performance of this contract, including
rolling stock, loaders, tractors, mowers, and any other specialized equipment. INDICATE WHETHER SUCH EQUIPMENT IS OWNED BY
THE COMPANY. Failure to complete and return this section may render Bidder's proposal non-responsive. The County reserves the
right to perform a site visit at the Vendor/Contractor’s location for purpose of verification of equipment listed and visual observation
of equipment condition.

Please provide a listing of the equipment and whether or not if it's company owned.

Example:
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Description of Equipment -- Company Owned
2019 Ford F350 Utility Truck -- Owned by Company/Bidder
SDR_Equipment_List_ & Pride.xlsx

15. HERNANDO COUNTY EMPLOYMENT DISCLOSURE CERTIFICATION STATEMENT

IS ANY OFFICER, PARTNER, DIRECTOR, PROPRIETOR, ASSOCIATE OR MEMBER OF THE BUSINESS ENTITY A FORMER EMPLOYEE OF
HERNANDO COUNTY WITHIN THE LAST TWO (2) YEARS? *
Pass

No

IS ANY OFFICER, PARTNER, DIRECTOR, PROPRIETOR, ASSOCIATE OR MEMBER OF THE BUSINESS ENTITY A RELATIVE OR MEMBER OF
THE HOUSEHOLD OF A CURRENT HERNANDO COUNTY EMPLOYEE THAT HAD OR WILL HAVE ANY INVOLVEMENT WITH THIS
PROCUREMENT OR CONTRACT AUTHORIZATION?*

Pass

No

RELATIVES AND FORMER HERNANDO COUNTY EMPLOYEES - ROLES AND SIGNATURES
Pass

Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

e HC Employment Disclosure Ce...

HC_Employment_Disclosure_Certification_Statement-SDR_Signed.pdf

SOLICITATION-OFFER-AWARD
Pass
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Please download the below document, complete Offer section, and upload.

e Solicitation-Offer-Award.pdf

Solicitation-Offer-Award_- SDR_Signed.pdf

REQUIRED GRANT FORMS
Pass

Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

e Suspension Debarment Certif...

e FEMA Certification for Lobb...

e Disclosure of Lobbying Acti...

e DBE-MBE-WBE-SUB Statement F...

e DBE-MBE-WBE STATEMENT OF GO...

DBE-MBE-WBE_STATEMENT_OF _GOOD_FAITH_EFFORTS-SDR_Signed.pdf
FEMA_Certification_for_Lobbying_- SDR_Signed.pdf
Suspension_Debarment_Certification_-_SDR_Signed.pdf

Disclosure_of Lobbying_Activities SF-LLL.pdf
DBE-MBE-WBE-SUB_Statement_Form.pdf

ADDITIONAL SUBMISSION INFORMATION (OPTIONAL)
Upload additional information (optional)

Technical _Proposal - Hernando_Co. FL 05.13.2024.pdf

PRICE TABLES
GROUP | - CUT AND TOSS OF DEBRIS FROM ROADWAY
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PHASE |

Line Item

Description

1 Two (2) Chainsaws - Appropriate Rubber Tire Equipment and Supervisor with
vehicle (including operators)

Unit of Measure

hour

Unit Cost

$357.00

GROUP Il - COLLECTION, HAULING TO STAGING SITE AND REDUCTION

PHASE Il
Line Item Description Origination Unit of Unit Cost
Point Measure
2 Loading and Hauling Vegetative Debris (Price to include MOT) From ROW to| Cubic Yard $7.75
DMS or (CY)
Directly to
Final Disposal
3 Debris Management Site (DMS) Management (to include preparation; N/A Cubic Yard $1.00
management; segregating at site and restoration of Department supplied site) (CY) of Debris
hauled into
the DMS
4 Debris Management Site (DMS) (provided by the Contractor after 7 days Noticeto | N/A Each Site $8,000.00
Proceed)
5 Reduction of Vegetative Debris - Grinding N/A CUBIC YARD $3.25
(CY)
6 Reduction of Vegetative Debris - Air Curtain Incineration CUBIC YARD $2.90
(CY)
7 Reduction of Vegetative Debris - Open Burning CUBIC YARD $1.95
(CY)
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Line Item Description Origination Unit of Unit Cost
Point \EENV] ]
8 Reduction of Vegetative Debris - Compacting CUBIC YARD $0.60
(CY)

9 Stump Removal (24"-48") (Price to include removal, disposal and backfilling costs) From ROW Each Stump $197.50
10 Stump Removal (> 48") (Price to include removal, disposal and backfilling costs) From ROW Each Stump $264.00
11 Removal of eligible hanging Limbs > 2" (Price to include cost of disposal) From ROW Tree $89.00
12 Removal of Leaning Trees > 6" @ 4.5' above the ground (Price to include cost of From ROW Tree $135.00

disposal) - 6" - < 12"

13 Removal of Leaning Trees > 6" @ 4.5' above the ground (Price to include cost of From ROW Tree $225.00
disposal) - 12" - < 24"

14 Removal of Leaning Trees > 6" @ 4.5' above the ground (Price to include cost of From ROW Tree $330.00
disposal) - 24" - < 36"

15 Removal of Leaning Trees > 6" @ 4.5' above the ground (Price to include cost of From ROW Tree $490.00
disposal) - > 36"

16 Loading and Hauling C&D Debris to a DMS (Price to include MOT) From ROW CUBIC YARD $8.25
(CY)

17 Loading and Hauling C&D Debris to a final disposal site (Price to include MOT) From ROW CUBIC YARD $9.75
(CY)

18 Loading and Hauling C&D Debris to a final disposal site (Price to include MOT) From DMS CUBIC YARD $6.90
(CY)

19 Sweeping Curb and Gutter N/A Curb Mile $325.00
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Line Item Description Origination Unit of Unit Cost No Bid
Point \EENV] ]
20 Vacuum Inlets N/A Each $295.00
21 White Goods Hauling and Final Recycling / Disposal From ROW Each $47.00
22 White Goods Hauling and Final Recycling / Disposal From DMS Each $35.00
23 White Goods Hauling and Final Recycling / Disposal From ROW Each $47.00
24 Removal and Disposal of oxygen depleting Freon/refrigerants; mercury or At DMS Each $45.00
compressor oils from White Good
25 Hazardous Household Waste (HHW) removal and disposal From ROW Pound $3.90
26 Hazardous Household Waste (HHW) removal and disposal From DMS Pound $2.50
27 Removal of Electronic Waste From ROW Each $37.00
28 Removal of trailers and vehicles (Price to include handling, hauling, storage and From ROW Each vehicle $590.00
disposal) and/or
waterways
29 Removal of Vessels < 30 feet (Price to include handling, hauling, storage and From ROW Linear Foor $143.00
disposal) and/or
waterways
30 Removal of Vessels > 30 feet (Price to include handling, hauling, storage and From ROW Linear Foot $195.00
disposal) and/or
waterways
31 Removal of Putrescent Debris, debris that will decompose or rot (animal carcasses |From ROW to| Per Pound $2.50
and organic fleshy matter) Final Disposal | (weight at
removal)
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Line Item Description Origination Unit of Unit Cost No Bid
Point Measure
32 Loading and Hauling Sand, Soil, Silt and Sediment From ROW CUBIC YARD S14.00
(CY)
33 Loading and Hauling Sand, Soil, Silt and Sediment From DMS CUBIC YARD $12.00
(CY)

GROUP Il — LOADING OF REDUCED MATERIAL AND FINAL DISPOSAL

PHASE Il
Line Item Description Origination Unit of Unit Cost No Bid
Point Measure
34 Loading and Hauling Reduced Debris for Vegetative and C&D Only (Price to include |From DMSto | Cubic Yard $6.90
MOQOT) Final Disposal (CY)
35 Disposal/Tipping Fees N/A ACTUAL No Bid X
COST
GROUP V —REQUIRED SERVICES
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
101 Storm Sewer, Culvert and/or Catch Basin Cleaning Foot (ft) $33.00
102 Debris Removal and Restoration of Retention Ponds, Lakes and/or Foot (ft) $49.00
Waterways/Canals
103 White Goods, as specified Each $52.00
104 Freon Recovery, as specified Each $45.00
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Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
105 Dead Animal Removal and Disposal Pound $2.50
106 Motor Vehicle Removal and Disposal - PASSENGER Each $320.00
107 Motor Vehicle Removal and Disposal - COMMERCIAL Each $490.00

GROUP VI - OPTIONAL SERVICES RED TIDE - CLEAN UP AND REMOVAL OF PUTRESCENT DEBRIS
RED TIDE - Clean Up and Removal of Putrescent Debris

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost
108 DRC Operations Manager Hour No Bid X
109 DRC Superintendent Hour No Bid X
110 Supervisor with Vehicle Hour No Bid X
111 Captain Hour No Bid X
112 Deck Hand Hour No Bid X
113 Marine Operator Hour No Bid X
114 Admin Assistant Hour No Bid X
115 Heavy Equipment Operator Hour No Bid X
116 Tool Operator Hour No Bid X
117 Laborer Hour No Bid X
118 Hazmat Worker Hour No Bid X
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Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
119 Mechanic with Truck and Tools 'Hour No Bid X
120 <14’ Work Boat Daily Rate No Bid X
121 >14" Work Boat Daily Rate No Bid X
122 Skimmer Boat Hour No Bid X
123 Beach Rake with Tractor Hour No Bid X
124 Boom per foot per day No Bid X
125 Barge 12 x 40 Hour No Bid X
126 Roll Off Dumpsters Daily Rate No Bid X
127 Roll Off Truck Daily Rate No Bid X

GROUP IV — OPTIONAL LOGISTICS AND PLANNING SERVICES

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
36 Hand Operated Transfer Pump (hourly rate) Hour No Bid X
37 Hand Operated Transfer Pump (daily rate) Day No Bid X
38 1” Diaphragm Pump Hour No Bid X
39 1” Diaphragm Pump Day No Bid X
40 2” Diaphragm Pump Hour No Bid X
41 2” Diaphragm Pump Day No Bid X
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T No. 24-TFO0708/AP
Disaster and Debris Removal Services

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
42 2” Diaphragm Pump S.S. Hour No Bid X
43 2” Diaphragm Pump S.S. Day No Bid X
44 3” Diaphragm Pump Hour No Bid X
45 3” Diaphragm Pump Day No Bid X
46 6” Diaphragm Pump Hour No Bid X
47 6” Diaphragm Pump Day No Bid X
48 1” Suction or Discharge Hose Hour No Bid X
49 1” Suction or Discharge Hose Day No Bid X
50 2” Suction or Discharge Hose Hour No Bid X
51 2” Suction or Discharge Hose Day No Bid X
52 3” Suction or Discharge Hose Hour No Bid X
53 3” Suction or Discharge Hose Day No Bid X
54 6” Suction or Discharge Hose Hour No Bid X
55 6” Suction or Discharge Hose Day No Bid X
56 2” Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose Hour No Bid X
57 2” Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose Day No Bid X
58 3” Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose Hour No Bid X
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[SOUTHERN DISASTER RECOVERY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
T No. 24-TFO0708/AP
Disaster and Debris Removal Services

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
59 3” Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose Day No Bid X
60 6" Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose Hour No Bid X
61 6" Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose Day No Bid X
62 185 CFM Compressor Hour No Bid X
63 185 CFM Compressor Day No Bid X
64 Air-hose Section, 50 feet Hour No Bid X
65 Air-hose Section, 50 feet Day No Bid X
66 Portable Lighting trailer Hour No Bid X
67 Portable Lighting trailer Day No Bid X
68 Diesel Powered Generator, 60kw - 80kw, 3 phase, 240/480 volt, trailer mounted, Hour No Bid X

including 50' of cabling w/plug
69 Diesel Powered Generator, 60kw - 80kw, 3 phase, 240/480 volt, trailer mounted, Day No Bid X
including 50' of cabling w/plug
70 Electrical Cable Section (50°) Hour No Bid X
71 Electrical Cable Section (50°) Day No Bid X
72 HEPA Vac Hour No Bid X
73 HEPA Vac Day No Bid X
74 Traffic Control Vest, Cones, Flags, Barrels, etc. Hour No Bid X
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T No. 24-TFO0708/AP
Disaster and Debris Removal Services

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
75 Traffic Control Vest, Cones, Flags, Barrels, etc. Day No Bid X
76 Extension Ladder, 28" — 35’ Hour No Bid X
77 Extension Ladder, 28" — 35’ Day No Bid X
78 Photographic Equipment Hour No Bid X
79 Photographic Equipment Day No Bid X
80 Portable Toilet Hour No Bid X
81 Portable Toilet Day No Bid X
82 Mechanized Broom Hour No Bid X
83 Mechanized Broom Day No Bid X
84 4 mil 20X100 Polyethylene Hour No Bid X
85 4 mil 20X100 Polyethylene Day No Bid X
86 6 mil 20X100 Polyethylene Hour No Bid X
87 6 mil 20X100 Polyethylene Day No Bid X
88 6 mil Bags Hour No Bid X
89 6 mil Bags Day No Bid X
90 55 — Gallon Drum, CEP-SD55THNEW, or equal Hour No Bid X
91 55 — Gallon Drum, CEP-SD55THNEW, or equal Day No Bid X
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T No. 24-TFO0708/AP
Disaster and Debris Removal Services

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
92 55 — Gallon Drum Liners, 10 mil Hour No Bid X
93 55 — Gallon Drum Liners, 10 mil Day No Bid X
94 Fiber Drums, CEP-FIB30L, or equal Hour No Bid X
95 Fiber Drums, CEP-FIB30L, or equal Day No Bid X
96 30 Gallon Over-pack, CEP-1230YE, or equal Hour No Bid X
97 30 Gallon Over-pack, CEP-1230VYE, or equal Day No Bid X
98 95 Gallon Poly Over-pack, CEP1237YE, or equal Hour No Bid X
99 95 Gallon Poly Over-pack, CEP1237YE, or equal Day No Bid X
100 Caution/Hazard Tape (per roll) Roll No Bid X
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