
RQ 61338
PD 02/17/23
CK 265426
VN 15789

By Frances Pioszak at 8:34 am, Feb 06, 2023



R

Vendor is normally an ACH. Live check will be cut for reissue. 
Check to be sent to physical address according to Vendor Reg. -df

REISSUE

Re-issue:
Ck# V521550
Vn# 15789

5071 - 08021 - 5303476

61338





ACH payment was returned on 2/14/23
due to a closed account. ACH voided
in eFinance+ on 2/15/23.

RH 2/15/23



ACCOUNT NUMBER:   0008800620976
OLB                                        SETTLEMENT DATE:  02/14/2023

PAGE       1

HERNANDO COUNTY BOARD OF CO
ATTN: BANKING ADMINISTRATOR
COMMISSIONERS
20 N MAIN ST ROOM 231
BROOKSVILLE FL 34601

TRUIST ACH ACTIVITY SUMMARY

FOR QUESTIONS REGARDING THIS REPORT, CALL TREASURY
SOLUTIONS CLIENT SUPPORT 1(800)774-8179

III. ITEMS RETURNED -

THIS REPORT LISTS THE RETURN ITEMS PROCESSED TODAY. THEY WILL
BE REFLECTED ON TODAYS SETTLEMENT.

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------
FILE REFERENCE  EFF DATE    COMPANY NAME     COMPANY ID  ENTRY DESCRIPTION
23040000875     02-10-2023  HERNANDO CO BOAR 2591155275  HERN CNTY
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------
RETURN     TRANSIT-                  INDIVIDUAL NAME/ID       ACCOUNT NUMBER/
REASON TC  ROUTING           AMOUNT  OR IAT ACCOUNT NUMBER    ORIGINAL TRACE
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------

R02   22  063108680      $3,439.71  BRIGGS INDUSTRIAL SOLU   41048121
15789                     061000100000006
R02 -ACCOUNT CLOSED        -

_________________
$3,439.71  CREDITS   NUMBER OF CREDITS:              1

NUMBER OF CREDIT PRENOTES:          0

THE RETURNS LISTED ABOVE WERE DEBITED/CREDITED TO YOUR ACCOUNT:
TOTAL CREDIT AMOUNT:           $3,439.71
TOTAL DEBIT AMOUNT:                $.00
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TRUIST ACH ACTIVITY SUMMARY

FOR QUESTIONS REGARDING THIS REPORT, CALL TREASURY
SOLUTIONS CLIENT SUPPORT 1(800)774-8179

R02 22 $3,439.71 BRIGGS INDUSTRIAL SOLU 

R02 -ACCOUNT CLOSED 

THE RETURNS LISTED ABOVE WERE DEBITED/CREDITED TO YOUR ACCOUNT:
TOTAL CREDIT AMOUNT: $3,439.71



  V. SETTLEMENT RECONCILIATION FOR TODAY -

     THIS SECTION LISTS THE SETTLEMENT CHARGES TO BE DEBITED/CREDITED
     TO YOUR ACCOUNT TODAY.

  RETURN ENTRIES
   . SETTLEMENT TO BE DEBITED/CREDITED         DEBIT AMOUNT       CREDIT AMOUNT
      TO YOUR ACCOUNT FOR RETURNED ENTRIES
      LISTED IN SECTION III:                             $.00           $3,439.71

  SECTION(S) III, AND V HAVE ACTIVITY.                E N D  OF  S T A T E M E N T





 

 

 



CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

From: Denise Flores
To: Brenda Peshel
Subject: RE: Briggs Industrial Solutions Inc
Date: Monday, February 6, 2023 8:32:00 AM
Attachments: image001.png

image002.png

Thank you for confirming!

Denise

From: Brenda Peshel <BPeshel@co.hernando.fl.us> 
Sent: Monday, February 6, 2023 8:31 AM
To: Denise Flores <dflores@hernandoclerk.org>
Subject: RE: Briggs Industrial Solutions Inc

Good Morning,

I just talked to them.  They will honor the 3439.71.  It took some talking.  

Thank you,

Brenda Peshel
Fleet Manager
Hernando County Fleet
(352)540-6508  Ext. 17611
(352)667-1351 Cell
bpeshel@co.hernando.fl.us

From: Denise Flores <dflores@hernandoclerk.org> 
Sent: Monday, February 6, 2023 8:09 AM
To: Brenda Peshel <BPeshel@co.hernando.fl.us>
Subject: Briggs Industrial Solutions Inc

Hi Brenda,

I have the Purchasing Policy Exception for Briggs Industrial Solutions and it’s entered for a total of
$3,439.71 in OnBase, however, the invoice notes to pay $3,508.50 after 12/11/22.  Do you know if the
vendor will honor the initial amount charged?



Denise Flores 
Board Accounting | Accounts Payable Auditor II 
Office of Doug Chorvat Jr., Clerk of Circuit Court and Comptroller
Phone: (352)540-6330 | Email: dflores@hernandoclerk.org
20 N Main Street, Brooksville, FL 34601

Visit our Website | Facebook | Twitter | How are we doing? | Property Fraud Alert

NOTICE:
Please note: Florida has a very broad Public Records Law. Most written communications to or from the Clerk's Office
are public records available to anyone upon request. Your e-mail, including your e-mail address, may therefore, be
subject to public disclosure.

       
 
Thanks!
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