County of Hernando

Purchasing and Contracts

Toni Brady, Chief Procurement Officer
15470 Flight Path Drive, Brooksville, FL 34604

EVALUATION TABULATION
T No. 23-T00025/GL

Hernando County Mosquito Control Pesticides
RESPONSE DEADLINE: February 22, 2023 at 3:00 pm
Report Generated: Monday, February 27, 2023

SELECTED VENDOR TOTALS
Vendor Total
ADAPCO, LLC $124,701.30
Target Specialty Products $229,234.30
Clarke Mosquito Control $670,963.30
Products, Inc.

TABLE 1
ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Target Specialty Products
Inc.
Selected Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
LARVICIDEES

X 1 (S)-Methoprene 300 Pounds $31.59 $9,477.00 $27.63 $8,289.00 $27.63 $8,289.00
4.25% Pellets

X 2 (S)-Methoprene 5 Case $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $768.00 $3,840.00 $768.00 $3,840.00
4.25% Water-
Soluble Pouch

X 3 (S)-Methoprene 10 Case No Bid No Bid $818.40 $8,184.00 $818.40 $8,184.00
2.1% 150 day

Briquet
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EVALUATION TABULATION
T No. 23-T00025/GL
Hernando County Mosquito Control Pesticides

ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Target Specialty Products
Inc.
Selected Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
X 4 (S)-Methoprene 20 40 Ib bag No Bid No Bid $778.80 $15,576.00 $778.80 $15,576.00
4.25% 35 day
Granule
X 5 (S)-Methoprene 5 Case No Bid No Bid $520.00 $2,600.00 $520.00 $2,600.00
8.62% 30 day
Briquet
X 6 (S)-Methoprene 20 40 Ib bag No Bid No Bid $242.80 $4,856.00 $497.60 $9,952.00
1.5% 30 day
Granule
X 7 (S)-Methoprene 20 40 Ib bag No Bid No Bid $390.80 $7,816.00 $390.80 $7,816.00
1.5% 21 day
Granule
X 8 (S)-Methoprene 10 Gallon No Bid No Bid $286.03 $2,860.30 $286.03 $2,860.30
5% Liquid
X 9 (S)-Methoprene 10 Gallon No Bid No Bid $1,017.70 $10,177.00 $1,017.70 $10,177.00
20% Liquid
X 10 (S)-Methoprene 5 40 Ib bag No Bid No Bid $140.80 $704.00 $140.80 $704.00
0.3% Pellet
X 11 (S)-Methoprene 5 40 Ib bag No Bid No Bid $497.60 $2,488.00 $497.60 $2,488.00
1.6% Granule
X 12 BTl 5.35%, (S)- 20 40 Ib bag No Bid No Bid $622.40 $12,448.00 $622.40 $12,448.00
Methoprene-
1.6%
X 13 BS 7.5% Water- 10 Case $974.47 $9,744.70 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Soluble Pouch
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EVALUATION TABULATION

T No. 23-T00025/GL

Hernando County Mosquito Control Pesticides

ADAPCO, LLC

Clarke Mosquito Control Products,

Target Specialty Products

Inc.
Selected Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
X 14 BTI11.61% 5 Gallon $38.30 $191.50 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Agueous
Suspension
X 15 BS 2.7%, BTI 5 Case $1,676.60 $8,383.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
4.5% Water-
Soluble Pouch
X 16 BTI 2.8% 20 40 Ib bag $76.00 $1,520.00 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $1,300.00
Granules
X 17 (S) - 2 200 $506.00 $1,012.00 No Bid No Bid $768.00 $1,536.00
Methoprene pouches/box
4.25% Pouch
X 18 BTI 6.07%, (S)- 10 40 Ib bag $177.02 $1,770.20 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Methoprene-
0.1% Granule
X 19 BTI 5% Granule 5 40 Ib bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
X 20 BTI 5% Water- 1 800/bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Soluble Pouch
X 21 BTI 8% Liquid 10 Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
X 22 Spinosyn A&D 150 Gallon No Bid No Bid $1,688.71 $253,306.50 $0.00 $0.00
20.6% Liquid
X 23 Spinosyn A&D 20 Case No Bid No Bid $1,210.00 $24,200.00 $0.00 $0.00
6.25% 180 day
Briquet
X 24 Spinosyn A&D 10 Case No Bid No Bid $852.00 $8,520.00 $0.00 $0.00
8.33% Tablet
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EVALUATION TABULATION
T No. 23-T00025/GL
Hernando County Mosquito Control Pesticides

ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Target Specialty Products
Inc.

Selected Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

X 25 Spinosyn A&D 2 Case No Bid No Bid $1,418.00 $2,836.00 $0.00 $0.00
7.48% Tablet

X 26 Spinosyn A&D 20 40 Ib bag No Bid No Bid $349.20 $6,984.00 $0.00 $0.00
0.5% Granule

Total $42,098.40 $375,684.80 $87,770.30
TABLE 2
ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Target Specialty Products
Inc.
Selected Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
ADULTICIDES
X 1 Etofenprox-4% 550 Gallon No Bid No Bid $86.78 $47,729.00 $86.78 $47,729.00
X 2 Etofenprox-20% 50 Gallon No Bid No Bid $346.20 $17,310.00 $346.20 $17,310.00
X 3 Prallethrin-1%, 550 Gallon No Bid No Bid $243.83 $134,106.50 $0.00 $0.00
Sumithrin-5%,
PBO-5%
X 4 Bifenthrin-7.9% 50 Gallon $60.28 $3,014.00 No Bid No Bid $57.50 $2,875.00
X 5 Naled-87.4% 30 Gallon $297.93 $8,937.90 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
X 6 Permethrin- 50 Gallon $138.89 $6,944.50 $105.00 $5,250.00 $77.00 $3,850.00
30%, PBO-30%
X 7 Permethrin 31% 50 Gallon $194.44 $9,722.00 $150.55 $7,527.50 $120.00 $6,000.00
- PBO 66%
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EVALUATION TABULATION
T No. 23-T00025/GL
Hernando County Mosquito Control Pesticides

ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Target Specialty Products
Inc.

Selected Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

X 8 Mineral Oil 25 Gallon $27.78 $694.50 $49.58 $1,239.50 $0.00 $0.00
Pesticide Grade

X 9 Tau-fluvalinate 50 Gallon No Bid No Bid $726.56 $36,328.00 $0.00 $0.00
—-22.3%

X 10 Sumethrin-10%, 50 Gallon No Bid No Bid $322.37 $16,118.50 $0.00 $0.00
PBO-10%

X 11 Deltamethrin- 50 Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $246.00 $12,300.00

2%

X 12 Sumethrin-2%, 50 Gallon No Bid No Bid $111.06 $5,553.00 $0.00 $0.00
PBO-2%

X 13 ULV Flushing 50 Gallon $21.11 $1,055.50 $68.64 $3,432.00 $25.00 $1,250.00
Solution

X 14 Chlorpyrifos, 50 Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00

water based

X 15 Sumethrin-10%, 50 Gallon No Bid No Bid $413.69 $20,684.50 $0.00 $0.00
PBO-10%, water
based

X 16 Pyrethrins 5%, 50 Gallon $258.98 $12,949.00 No Bid No Bid $243.00 $12,150.00
PBO 25%

X 17 12% Pyrethrin, 50 Gallon $605.39 $30,269.50 No Bid No Bid $517.00 $25,850.00
60% Piperonyl
Butoxide

X 18 5% Pyrethrin, 50 Gallon $180.32 $9,016.00 No Bid No Bid $243.00 $12,150.00
25% Piperonyl
Butoxide
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EVALUATION TABULATION
T No. 23-T00025/GL
Hernando County Mosquito Control Pesticides

ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Target Specialty Products
Inc.

Selected Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

Total $82,602.90 $295,278.50 $141,464.00
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