
HERNANDO COUNTY TRANSPORT

$256,877.04

$319,035.40

$374,784.24

EST. 
TONS

PRICE PER 
TON TOTAL BID

MILES 
LANDFILL TO 

VENDOR-
Roundtrip

COUNTY 
MILEAGE RATE

# OF ESTIMATED 
DELIVERY DAYS

COUNTY 
TRANSPORATION 

COSTS

TOTAL EST. 
COST TO 
COUNTY

A B C = A x B D E F G= D x E x F H = C + G

RECYCLING SERVICES 
OF FLORIDA, INC. 1

Processing Fee for recyclables from the County's recycling program, at a location other 
than the collection area located at the County landfill, with Hernando County 
transporting via one-hundred yard trailers.  3700 $60.23 $222,851.00 106.0 $3.49 260 $96,184.40 $319,035.40

WASTE MANAGEMENT 
INC. OF FLORIDA

1
Processing Fee for recyclables from the County's recycling program, at a location other 
than the collection area located at the County landfill, with Hernando County 
transporting via one-hundred yard trailers.  3700 $45.00 $166,500.00 99.6 $3.49 260 $90,377.04 $256,877.04

WASTE PRO OF FLORIDA, 
INC.

1
Processing Fee for recyclables from the County's recycling program, at a location other 
than the collection area located at the County landfill, with Hernando County 
transporting via one-hundred yard trailers.  3700 $70.00 $259,000.00 127.6 $3.49 260 $115,784.24 $374,784.24

EST. 
TONS

PRICE PER 
TON TOTAL BID

A B C = A x B

RECYCLING SERVICES 
OF FLORIDA, INC. 1

Processing Fee recyclables from the County's recycling program, at a location other 
than the collection area located at the County landfill, with the Vendor/Contractor 
transporting. 3700 $119.23 $441,151.00

WASTE MANAGEMENT 
INC. OF FLORIDA

1
Processing Fee recyclables from the County's recycling program, at a location other 
than the collection area located at the County landfill, with the Vendor/Contractor 
transporting. 3700 --- NO BID

WASTE PRO OF FLORIDA, 
INC.

1
Processing Fee recyclables from the County's recycling program, at a location other 
than the collection area located at the County landfill, with the Vendor/Contractor 
transporting. 3700 --- NO BID

County of Hernando
Procurement Department

Carla Rossiter-Smith, Chief Procurement Officer
15470 Flight Path Drive, Brooksville, FL 34604

EVALUATION TABULATION 
Recycling Processing - ITB No. 25-T01029/JC - Response Deadline: May 12, 2025

Bidder Name Description

RECYCLING SERVICES OF 
FLORIDA, INC.

WASTE MANAGEMENT INC. OF 
FLORIDA

WASTE PRO OF FLORIDA, INC.

Bidder Name VENDOR/CONTRACTOR TRANSPORT

NO BID

$441,151.00

NO BID

VENDOR SUMMARY (lowest to highest bid)

Bidder Name Description
Line 

Item #

Line 
Item #

HERNANDO COUNTY TRANSPORT

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR TRANSPORT

8.A.1. HERNANDO COUNTY TRANSPORT - The bidder will provide the name and address of the processing location in Question #4.4, of Section 10, Vendor Questionnaire.  The County will then calculate the mileage from the Main
Landfill to the Processing Location, and multiply the roundtrip distance by the County's established mileage rate of $3.49 per mile, and then by 260 (number of estimated delivery days), to determine the estimated annual cost of
transportation.  This transportation cost will then be added to the Processing Fee entered in the HERNANDO COUNTY TRANSPORT – Pricing Proposal, to arrive at the Total Bid for Materials transported by Hernando County. Mileage
rate will not be paid to the Vendor/Contractor.  It is only being used as part of the calculation to provide the County a basis of comparison in determining true costs.
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