
AGENDA ITEM M 1 (13632) 

From: 
To: 
Subject: 
Date: 
Attachments: 

Joni Brady 
Colleen v. Conko 
FW: Civil Restitution Lien Order Satisfaction of Lien Form 2011CF11793 
Monday, February 12, 2024 8:58:26 AM 
;maaeoo1.ona 
;maaeoo2 pna 

Can you have copies of this for all parties for tomorrow. 

From: Jeffrey Rogers <JRogers@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Sent: Monday, February 12, 2024 8:51 AM 

To: Toni Brady <TBrady@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Subject: FW: Civil Restitution Lien Order Satisfaction of Lien Form 2011CF11793 

Jeffrey Rogers, P.E. 

County Administrator 

Hernando County 

15470 Flight Path Drive 

Brooksville, FL 34604 

(352)754-4841 

jrogers@hernandocounty.us 

Sign up to receive the Hernando Highljghts monthly newsletter! 

From: Tim Martin <Turczynskj1981@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Saturday, February 10, 2024 10:26 PM 

To: Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us>; John Allocco <JAllocco@co hernando fl us>; Elizabeth 

Narverud <ENarverud@co hernando fl us>; Steve Champion <SChampioo@cohernando.fl.us>; 

Jeffrey Rogers <JRogers@co.hernando.fl.us>; Brian Hawkins <BHawkios@co hernando fl us>; Jerry 

Campbell <JerryC@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Cc: Melissa Tartaglia <mtartaglja@co hernando.fl.us> 

Subject: Civil Restitution Lien Order Satisfaction of Lien Form 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe. 

Ok thanks so much for all your time and consideration the past few months. Mrs. Hare you have 

been a pleasure. Please add this to the hearing agenda please. 

I am disabled and they are proposing a very low hourly number. I'm not supposed to be doing much 

labor at al l and I don't think I can perform the hours that I was offered to do. The board and staff 

already knew I was disabled from the beginning of these hearings. 



I think I want to ask the board to just forgive this CRLO total balance at this point. I can't volunteer 8 

hours a week I know my body can't handle it. 

The only reason I asked for community service hours was to get this lien taken care of so I can 

restore my civil rights through the clemency board in Tallahassee and I don't have ways to put out of 

pocket due to being indigent. I keep getting denied the right to restore my civil rights due to this 

CRLO balance. I have been denied 3x now from the Clemency Board because of this lien order which 

they say is not part of my case but it is if it wasn't I would have been granted clemency. 

I have not been arrested or been in any kind of trouble since 2012. (That 's 12 Years of no arrests) I 

paid the county, the victim, and the state off in full. I try to help others in the community by 

volunteering my time and being productive in county events one being Operation backpack. I'm a 

Third Degree Knight in the Knights of Columbus. I did my time in jail, learned my lesson, and I have 

paid my debt to society. 

I have accomplished one major thing here that I am very proud of the Hernando County Commission 

now has a plan in place to help former inmates trying to get their lives back the chance to request 

working off their CRLO balance with community service hours which allows them to get this off back 

if they are unable to come out of pocket for their balance. 

I was not disabled back in 2012 but I am now. I can't work doing any kind of labor due to my physical 

and mental conditions. I have Stage 3 kidney Fai lure, PTSD, and I also suffer from bipolar disorder. 

I have been found by the Hernando County Courts to be INDIGENT on many occasions am I still am 

today. I can provide the paperwork to show you I'm indigent and disabled. 

I am requesting the Hernando County Board of Commissioners to please Forgive my CRLO Total 

Balance and to issue me a Satisfaction of Lien today due to disability and medical reasons please. 

Thank you for your time and consideration Board Members, Administration Staff, Legal Team, and 

anyone else involved in my proposal and Request 

Timothy D. Martin 

3251 Welsh St 

Spring Hill, FL 34606 

352-835-8315 

Get Outlook for Android 

From: Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Sent: Friday, February 9, 2024 9:57:02 AM 

To: Tim Martin <Jurczynski1981@hotmail.com> 

Cc: Melissa Tartaglia <mtartaglia@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Subject: RE: Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 



Sorry, but the Board has never allowed for that, even during COVID . 

Pam Hare 

Hernando County Attorney's Office 

352/540-6422 direct 

From: Tim Martin <Jurczynskj198l@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Friday, February 9, 2024 9:55 AM 

To: Pamela Hare <PHare@co hernando.fl.us> 

Cc: Melissa Tartaglia <mtartaglia@co.hernando fl us> 

Subject: Re: Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe. 

I needed to see if you all do zoom yet for people that can't be in attendance. 

Get Outlook for Android 

From: Pamela Hare <PHare@co hernando fl us> 

Sent: Th ursday, February 8, 2024 8:54:35 AM 

To: Tim Martin <Jurczynskj1981@hotmail com> 

Cc: Melissa Tartaglia <mtartaglia@co hernando fl us> 

Subject: RE: Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

Good morning, Mr. Martin. 

The proposed agreement concerning your request is on the agenda for the February 13, 

2024 meeting of the Board of Count y Commissioners as item no. M-1 . A copy of the 

agenda is attached here for you . We w ill inform the County Administrator that you w ill be 

in attendance. 

Pam Hare 

Hernando County Attorney's Office 

352/540-6422 direct 

From: Tim Martin <Turczynskj1981@hotmail com> 

Sent: Friday, February 2, 2024 1:10 PM 

To: Melissa Tartaglia <mtartaglia@co.hernando fl us>; Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Subject: Re: Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 



or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe . 

Mrs. Hare I wil l be there on Feb 13th, 2022. I am going to present. Will we be one of the first to be 

called up in front of the board . Thanks Timothy D. Martin 

Get Outlook for Android 

From: Tim Martin <Jurczynski1981@hotmai1.com> 

Sent: Thursday, February 1, 2024 2:42:59 PM 

To: Melissa Tartaglia <mtartaglia@cohernando.fl.us>; Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 
Subject: Re: Civi l Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

Mrs .Tartaglia, 

$7.25 is very low per hour for community service hours. I have no legal counsel or do I intend on 

getting one. I just thought that it would be $10.00 an hour at minimum per community service 

hours. 

Get Outlook for Android 

From: Melissa Tartaglia <mtartaglia@co,hernando.fl us> 

Sent: Thursday, February 1, 2024 12 :38 :46 PM 

To: Tim Martin <Jurczynski1981@hotmail.com>; Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Subject: RE : Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

Good afternoon, Mr. Martin: 

BE ADVISED: If you are represented by legal counsel in this matter, please refer this 

correspondence to your legal counsel. This correspondence is not intended to offer you legal 

advice. 

You are referred to sections 318.18(8}(b) and 938.30(2), Fla . Stat. (2023), and to 29 USC s. 206(a}{l}. 

The proposed agreement is to convert your Civil Rest itution Lien Order amount to a specified hourly 

credit rate, not wages, for your participation in community service. Florida law does not permit your 

lien to be converted to wages. 

It is recommended that you consult with your legal counsel, at your expense, if you need advice 

regarding the proposed agreement. 

Sincerely, 

Melissa A. Tartaglia, Esq . 



FBN: 0116033 

Asst . County Attorney 

Office of Jon A. Jouben, Hernando County Attorney 

20 N. Main St. 

Brooksville, FL 34601 

(352) 754-4122 ext . 20137 

From: Tim Martin <Turczynski1981@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Thursday, February 1, 2024 11:52 AM 

To: Pamela Hare <PHare@co hernando fl us> 

Cc: Melissa Tartagl ia <mtartaglia@co.hernando.fl us> 

Subject: Re: Civil Rest itut ion Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe. 

7.25 is below minimum wage. 

Get Outlook for Android 

From: Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Sent: Thursday, February 1, 2024 11 :50:50 AM 

To: Tim Martin <Turczynski1981@hotmail.com> 

Cc: Melissa Tartagl ia <mtartaglia@co hernando fl us> 

Subject: RE: Civil Resti t ution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

Good morning. 

Idea lly, outside pa rties are asked t o sign agreement s before presentation to t he Board, but 

it is not required. The decision to handle your request t his way was made by t he County 

Administrator's office (Admin). Please confirm whether or not you'll be able to make t he 

meeting on Tuesday so Ad min can be informed. 

I believe t he $7.25 rate stems from the CRLO being a civil lien - not criminal - hence the title 

"Civil Restitution Lien Order." The at torney who prepared the agreement is copied here 

and ca n chime in if th is is incorrect. 

Pam Hare 

Hernando County Attorney's Office 



352/54 0-6422 direct 

From: Tim Martin <Turczynski198l@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, Febru ary 1, 2024 11:30 AM 

To: Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 
Subject: Re: Civil Restitut ion Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe . 

Mrs. Hare I'm going to try to make it but 10.00 an hour is what you get if you do community service 

hours in Crimina l Court right? I just want to do the hours closer to my house if possible at Narcoti cs 

Anonymous or Home of Foam. I'm not trying to be a problem at all. I thought they wanted me to 

sign before the heari ng. 

Thanks, Timothy D. Martin 

Get Outlook for Android 

From: Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Sent: Wednesday, January 31, 2024 3:09:46 PM 

To: Tim Martin <Jurczynski1981@hotmail com> 

Subject: RE : Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

Good afternoon, Mr. Martin. 

The proposed agreement addressing your request to perform community service in lieu of 

paying your Civil Restitution Lien Order w ill be cons idered by the Board of County 

Commissioners on Tuesday, February 13. The meeting sta rts at 9AM. The Board will be 

made aware that you oppose certain aspects of the agreement, so please be prepared t o 

discuss those . 

Pam Hare 

Hernando County Attorney's Office 

352/540-6422 direct 

From: Tim Martin <Turczynskj198l@hotmail com> 

Sent: Sunday, December 24, 2023 11:33 AM 

To: Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Subject: Re: Civi l Restitut ion Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 



or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe. 

Ms. Hare just keep me informed as to when the discussion or vote 
will come up about me doing community service hours in lieu of my 
civil restitution lien. I would love to be there. Thanks Tim Martin 

From: Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 
Sent: Tuesday, December 12, 2023 5:05 PM 

To: Tim Martin <Jurczynski1981@hotmail com> 
Subject: RE: Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

Hello, Mr. Martin. 

The way I understood their discussion is that the County Administrator was tasked to bring 

them ideas on how to calcu late the community service hours. Once that gets worked out, 

they w ill have t o take a formal vote on your reque st. They did not establish a date certain 

for that t o happen, so I can let you know w hen it comes back on the agenda if you'd like, or 

you can monitor the agendas on your own at this website: 

https://hernandocountyfl.legistar.com/Calendar.aspx. 

Pam Hare 
Hernando County Attorney's Office 

352/540-6422 direct 

From: Tim Martin <Jurczynskj1981@hotmail,com> 
Sent: Tuesday, December 12, 2023 4:52 PM 

To: Pamela Hare <PHare@co,hernandofl.us> 
Subject: Re: Civi l Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe . 

Can you explain what happens now at this point. What happens does the board meet again about 

my request from today's meeting. Thanks, 

Timot hy D. Martin 

Get Outlook for Android 

From: Pamela Hare <PHare@co hernando.fl.us> 
Sent: Tuesday, December 12, 2023 8:55:37 AM 

To: Tim Martin <Jurczynskj1981@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 



Good morning, Mr. Martin. 

After the agenda ha s been fina lized and made available t o the public, staff is prohibited 

from adding materials to any agenda item. However, you will have an opportunity to 

further explain your circumstances when the Board of County Commissioners considers 

your request during today's meeting. 

Pam Hare 

Hernando County Attorney's Office 

352/540-6422 direct 

From: Tim Martin <Turczynski1981@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, December 11, 2023 2:49 PM 

To: Pamela Hare <PHare@co hernando fl us> 
Subject: Re: Civi l Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe. 

WILL YOU PLEASE ATTACH THE LETTER THAT I EMAILED THE 
COMMISSIONERS YESTERDAY TO MY FILE NUMBER FOR 
TOMORROWS MEETING. THANKS TIMOTHY D. MARTIN 

From: Pamela Hare <PHare@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Sent: Monday, December 11, 2023 9:13 AM 

To: Tim Martin <Turczynski198l@hotmail com> 
Subject: RE: Civi l Rest itution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

Good morning, Mr. Martin. 

Your assumption is correct. If the Board of County Commissioners votes t o approve your 

request, the discharge form would be signed and recorded as proof that the CR LO is no 

longer a lien against you . 

Pam Hare 

Hernando County Attorney's Office 

352/540-6422 direct 

From: Tim Martin <Jurczynski1981@hotmail com> 

Sent: Sunday, December 10, 2023 2:20 PM 

To: Pamela Hare <PHare@co hernando.fLus> 



Subject: Re: Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not cl ick links 
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe . 

Mrs. Hare why do they have a discharge of Civil Restitution Lien 
order form under the agenda is this if they do vote in my favor on this 
matter? Thanks for all your help on this matter. Timothy David Martin 

From: Pamela Hare <PHare@co hernando.f!.us> 

Sent: Monday, November 13, 2023 12:29 PM 

To: Tim Martin <Turczynski1981@hotmail.com> 

Cc: Steve Champion <SChampioo@co hernando fl us>; John Allocco <JAllocco@co.hernandofl.us>; 

Brian Hawkins <BHawkios@co.hernando.fl.us>; Elizabeth Narverud <ENarverud@co hernando fl us>; 

Jerry Campbell <JerryC@cohernando.f!.us>; Jon Jouben <JJouben@co.hernando.fl.us> 

Subject: RE: Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

Good afternoon, Mr. Martin. 

Your request is scheduled to be considered on Tuesday, December 12. The meeting begins 

at 9AM at the Hernando County Courthouse, 20 North Main Street, Room 160, Brooksville . 

Pamela R. Hare, FRP 

Paralegal Director 

Hernando County Attorney's Office 

20 N. Main St, Rm 462 

Brooksvi ll e, FL 34601 

352/754-4122 ( office) 

352/540-6422 ( direct) 

From: Tim Martin <Turczynski1981@botmail.com> 

Sent: Sunday, November 12, 2023 5:03 PM 

To: County Attorney Office <cao@hernandocounty us>; Steve Champion 

<SChampioo@co hernando fl us>; John Allocco <JAllocco@co.hernando.fl us>; Brian Hawkins 

<BHawkios@co.hernandofl.us>; Elizabeth Narverud <ENarverud@co hernando fl us>; Jerry 

Campbell <JerryC@co hernando fl us> 



Subject: Re: Civil Resti tution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe. 

What date will my case be presented to the board? I want to make sure 
that I am there if the board has any questions for me? 

I just want the Hernando County Board of County 
Commissioners to know that when I plead nolo contendere on my case 
on July 17, 2012 and was sentenced to six months in the Hernando 
County Jail 

"I was not informed by the public defender's office that the Judge 
was going to come after I plead out and was sentenced and sign a 
civil restitution lien order for cost of incarceration on me on August 
22, 2012. If I would have known that the civil lien was going to be 
put on me, I could have taken this case to trial and won and not had 
to pay anything for cost of incarceration. The Hernando County 
Public Defender's office failed me by not informing me of these civil 
restitution lien orders for cost of incarceration. I did not know that 
this lien was going to be put on me". 

I don't think this is fair of the Public Defender's Office to not 
inform me of this major lien that would be put on me before I plead out. 
I was assigned to Ray Shaw he got sick and then came in David Bauer 
on the day of court. I did not even have any legal counsel until 5 
minutes before I was due to see Judge Merritt. 

The fact of the matter is I was not informed of the civil 
restitution lien order for cost of incarceration. If I would have known of 
this, I would have taken this case to trial and won. This would have 
impacted the way I would have gone with the outcome of my case. You 
can look at my court case 2011 CF 1 793 and see that I was never made 
aware of this civil restitution lien until August 22, 2012. I resolved this 



case on July 17, 2012. 

I am asking that the board please forgive this balance of $9,000 
plus interest and give me the satisfaction of lien paperwork, reduce this 
balance, and/or let me work it off with community service hours to the 
board of county commissioners or the Hernando County Government 
please so I can move on with my life. Just because I am labeled a Felon 
does not mean that I am a bad person and don't deserve to be informed 
in my own legal case. 

Thank you and Best Regards, 
Timothy D. Martin 

From: County Attorney Office <cao@hernandocounty.us> 

Sent: Friday, November 3, 2023 5:13 PM 

To: turczynski1981@hotmail.com <turczynski1981@hotmail.com> 

Cc: Steve Champion <SChampioo@co hernando fl us>; John Allocco <JAllocco@co.hernando.fl.us>; 

Jon Jouben <JJouben@co hernando fl us> 

Subject: FW: Civil Restit ut ion Li en Order Forgiveness 2011CF1 1793 

Good afternoon, Mr. Martin . 

The County Attorney's Office will present your request for forgiveness of the Civil 

Restitution Lien Order (CRLO) t o the Board of County Commissioners at an upcoming 

public meeting. You w ill be notified next week of that date. 

Pamela R. Hare, FRP 

Paralegal Director 

Hernando County Attorney's Office 

20 N. Ma in St, Rm 462 

Brooksville, FL 34601 

352/754-4122 ( office) 

352/540-6422 ( direct) 

From: Tim Martin <Turczynski1981@hotmail com> 

Sent: Friday, November 3, 2023 4:48 PM 

To: Steve Champion <SChampioo@cohernando.fl.us> 



Cc: John Allocco <JAllocco@co.hernando.fl.us> 
Subject: Civil Restitution Lien Order Forgiveness 2011CF11793 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization . Do not click links 
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 
safe. 

I have a fi nancial hardship and am not able to pay at all on this Civil Restitution Lien order. I get 

Social Security Disability each month (914.00) and after my monthly bil ls I am not able to pay on th is 

resti tut ion order. I also help care for a good friend of mine on a dai ly basis that has intellectual 

disabilities. 

I recently applied for Clemency to restore my civil rights and for the third time was denied 

because of this restitution lied order for cost of incarceration . Will the board please allow me 

to do Community Service to Hernando County or to The Board to satisfy this lien or forgive 

this lien balance in full. I have not had any legal trouble since 2012 and am now a productive 

citizen here in Hernando County. 

Since 2013 I have had great encounters with John Allocco, Jeff Holcomb, and Steve Champion 

all throughout Hernando County w ith events such as Operation backpack and American Pawn 

etc .. I love and cherish loving in beautiful Hernando County and need my civil rights restored 

so I can put this behind me but my financial hardship will not allow me to pay on this 

restitution lien order. Is there anyway the County Attorney and The Hernando County Board of 

Commissioners can help me. 

Thanks for your time and consideration on this matter 

Timothy D. Martin 

3251 Welsh Street 

Spring Hill FL 34606 

(352) 835-8315 

Get Outlook for Android 


