
PURCHASE ORDER NO.HERNANDO COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
15470 FLIGHT PATH DR

BROOKSVILLE, FL  34604
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ORDER DATE: BUYER: REQ. NO.: REQ. DATE:

TERMS: F.O.B.: DESC.:
ITEM# QUANTITY UOM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

ITEM# ACCOUNT AMOUNT PROJECT CODE PAGE TOTAL $
TOTAL $

APPROVED BY:**SEE TERMS AND CONDITIONS ON REVERSE SIDE**
CHIEF PROCUREMENT OFFICER

                                                                       23000114

                                                              PAGE NO. 1

carol@deebcompanies.net
11228             FAX: 727-376-5973
DEEB CONSTRUCTION & DEVELOPMENT
9400 RIVER CROSSING BLVD
SUITE 102
NEW PORT RICHEY FL  34655

HC CONSOLIDATED FIRE
HC FIRE ADMINISTRATION
60 VETERANS AVENUE
BROOKSVILLE, FL 34601

10/24/22 DKAFRISSEN 0

NET 30 DAYS DESTINATION EPO WATER&SEWER MODULAR

                 This Emergency Purchase is in accordance Hernando
                 County Purchasing Policy 060F.  The estimated dollar
                 amount reflected is only a County estimate.  The
                 Contractor/Vendor shall provide final invoice to the
                 County Project Manager detailing the actual costs
                 involve for final invoicing amount.  The Department
                 will process a Change Order to the Purchase Order
                 revising the amount of the emergency for processing
                 and payment by Accounts Payable. County Terms and
                 Conditions are identified this purchase order.

                 The County Contact Person is: Erik van de Boogard,
                 Phone Number: (352) 754-4096
                 The Contractor Contact is: Paul Taylor, Phone Number:
                 (352) 376-6831
01 100942.61 JOB EPO WATER AND SEWER LINE INSTALLATION         1.0000    100,942.61
                 FOR MODULAR AT STATION 2

                                                                         100,942.61
                                                                         100,942.61
01 02261            5304601       60,565.56
01 02491            5304601       40,377.05
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From: Carla Rossiter-Smith
To: Diane Kafrissen; Jane Gonzalez
Subject: FW: emergency PO-modular station 2
Date: Monday, October 24, 2022 10:08:51 AM
Attachments: image003.png

image004.png

FYI, thanks.

Carla Rossiter-Smith, MSM PMP
Procurement and Grants Manager
Crossiter-smith@co.hernando.fl.us
Office: (352) 754-4004 ext. 24153
Cell: (352) 667-4272

From: Toni Brady <TBrady@co.hernando.fl.us> 
Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 8:33 AM
To: Erik Van De Boogaard <EVanDeBoogaard@co.hernando.fl.us>; Carla Rossiter-Smith <CRossiter-
Smith@co.hernando.fl.us>
Cc: Jeffrey Rogers <JRogers@co.hernando.fl.us>; James Billotte <JBillotte@co.hernando.fl.us>; Kelly
Trout <KTrout@co.hernando.fl.us>; Gordon Onderdonk <GOnderdonk@co.hernando.fl.us>; Diane
Kafrissen <DKafrissen@co.hernando.fl.us>; Paul Hasenmeier <phasenmeier@co.hernando.fl.us>
Subject: RE: emergency PO-modular station 2

HCFES will need to put an EPO request into Purchasing.  Purchasing will then process the EPO today so
we can get the work started.

From: Erik Van De Boogaard <EVanDeBoogaard@co.hernando.fl.us> 
Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 7:09 AM
To: Toni Brady <TBrady@co.hernando.fl.us>; Carla Rossiter-Smith <CRossiter-
Smith@co.hernando.fl.us>
Cc: Jeffrey Rogers <JRogers@co.hernando.fl.us>; James Billotte <JBillotte@co.hernando.fl.us>; Kelly
Trout <KTrout@co.hernando.fl.us>; Gordon Onderdonk <GOnderdonk@co.hernando.fl.us>; Diane
Kafrissen <DKafrissen@co.hernando.fl.us>; Paul Hasenmeier <phasenmeier@co.hernando.fl.us>
Subject: emergency PO-modular station 2

Toni and Carla,
Please review the email below regarding the procurement of water and sewer line installation
services for the modular at station 2.
A brief history of our attempts to bid the installation of the modular.
We tried unsuccessfully to bid the work twice through our pre-approved vendors.  Participation was
limited and did not result in any fruitful total package due to the diversity in the scope of work.
We then attempted to go the typical bid route.  Again, participation was limited and resulted in one
bid.  We canceled that bid after review of the bid details and determined it would be beneficial to
include the scope as part of the overall Station 2 demolition and construction.  That bid has been



ready to go since July 29th and has yet to be placed on the street for bidding.
As you are aware, a recent mold issue has taken place resulting in the relocation of fire crews to the
adjacent training facility.  This facility is limited in the services available to the crew and allows for
sleeping and office duties with no kitchen services.
When the mold issue arose, we began to brainstorm other options.  We settled on an approach in
consult with the Supervisor of elections that would provide an overall less costly installation location,
along with reducing scope that would have made for a lengthy installation including gopher tortoise
removal and the expansion of the retention pond.  These items are still required in the overall Station
2 project, however, not required for the temporary sitting of the modular on the existing parking lot
behind the warehouse used by the Supervisor of elections.  The site is available to us on November

15th.
Discussions with fire administration and County Administration have been on going to find a way to
expedite the installation of the modular.  One such idea was to have our utilities division provide the
labor and materials to install utilities.  This has proved not an option at this time.  However, upon
communicating our revised plans with Gordon Onderdonk, he contacted a contractor that they utilize
for many of their projects.  The contractor visited the site and has provided a quote for the installation
of the water line.  The total cost exceeds any current dollar limits and would require an open
solicitation.
We understand that an emergency procurement is an option with adequate justification.  The Fire
Department can provide details for the justification.
I offer the following information in support of this approach.

On May 11th, 2022, we received one bid for the previously mentioned solicitation.  The water
distribution portion of work is detailed below:
PART D: SANITARY SEWER
23 E-ONE Grinder Pump DH151 W/ Ballast Installed LS 1 $ 22,000.00 $ 22,000.00
24 Electric Connection and Start Up LS 1 $ 1,500.00 $ 1,500.00
25 Connect Pump Station to Modular Building LS 1 $ 3,500.00 $ 3,500.00
26 1.25" SCH 40 PVC Force Main LF 160 $ 40.00 $ 6,400.00
27 Sawcut and Trench Exist Concrete./ Pavement and Repair SY 85 $ 130.00 $ 11,050.00
28 Connect to Existing Clean Out LS 1 $ 800.00 $ 800.00
PART D - SUBTOTAL $ 45,250.0
PART E: WATER DISTRIBUTION
29 1" SCH. 40 PVC Water Main (potable) LF 297 $ 35.00 $ 10,395.00
30 2" SCH. 40 PVC Fire Line LF 297 $ 110.00 $ 32,670.00
31 Connect to Existing WM LS 1 $ 1,400.00 $ 1,400.00
32 Sawcut and Trench Exist Conc./ Pvmt. And Repair SY 278 $ 130.00 $ 36,140.00
33 6"x6" Full Body Tapping Sleeve and Valve EA 1 $ 11,000.00 $ 11,000.00
34 6"x3" Tee Cap EA 1 $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
35 6" Reduced Pressure Detector Assembly W/ Bi-Pass Meter LS 1 $ 20,000.00 $ 20,000.00
36 6" PVC (DR 14) Fire Line LF 20 $ 120.00 $ 2,400.00
37 6" Tee EA 1 $ 950.00 $ 950.00
38 6"x2" Reducer EA 1 $ 400.00 $ 400.00
PART E - SUBTOTAL $116,355.00
Total for water and sewer:          $161,605
Gordon’s Contractor quote below:



While some of the scope above has been removed and or altered, we find the pricing to be in line if
not less than that of the formal bid we received on a line-by-line basis.
Therefore, we believe that the pricing we have from Gordon’s contractor provides the highest value
to the County and that an emergency PO be issued to perform the scope of work as outlined in the
proposal and identified on the revised plans and specifications from Coastal Engineering.
Please provide guidance with this request.

From: Gordon Onderdonk <GOnderdonk@co.hernando.fl.us> 
Sent: Friday, October 21, 2022 4:57 PM
To: Erik Van De Boogaard <EVanDeBoogaard@co.hernando.fl.us>
Subject: RE: A few additional plans

We don’t have a contract with them unfortunately. I was thinking it could be done as part of an
emergency PO since it deals with a sick building having mold issues and employee safety. Also, this
contractor happens to have the backflow preventer in stock. However, the emergency justification
would need to come from fire and approved through purchasing. It would also need to be ratified
through the board, so I would make sure administration is okay with it before proceeding.

Gordon Onderdonk, PE, LEED AP
Director of Utilities



CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links
or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is
safe.

Hernando County Utilities Department
15365 Cortez Boulevard
Brooksville, FL 34613
Office: 352-540-4368
Fax:     352-754-4485
gonderdonk@co.hernando.fl.us
https://www.hernandocounty.us/utils/

Sign up to receive the Hernando Highlights monthly newsletter!

From: Erik Van De Boogaard <EVanDeBoogaard@co.hernando.fl.us> 
Sent: Friday, October 21, 2022 12:06 PM
To: Gordon Onderdonk <GOnderdonk@co.hernando.fl.us>
Subject: FW: A few additional plans

FYI, how or what procurement process can be used to do this?

Erik

From: ptaylor.deeb@yahoo.com <ptaylor.deeb@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 21, 2022 10:54 AM
To: Erik Van De Boogaard <EVanDeBoogaard@co.hernando.fl.us>
Subject: Re: A few additional plans

See attached proposal. I did add in survey and asbuilts to the proposal in case utilities
wants them. I can have all the materials delivered within a week.

Paul

On Tuesday, October 18, 2022 at 04:29:06 PM EDT, Erik Van De Boogaard
<evandeboogaard@co.hernando.fl.us> wrote:



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

                               

 

Erik van de Boogaard, CGC1526021

Hernando County Construction Projects Coordinator

1525 E. Jefferson Street

Brooksville, FL 34601

evandeboogaard@co.hernando.fl.us

Office 352-754-4096 ext-17037

Cell 352-651-8265

 


