EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB NO. 24-TFO0708/AP
DISASTER AND DEBRIS REMOVAL SERVICES

.

m-

Two (2) Chainsaws -
1

.Ion‘ﬂ

PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT

GROUP | - CUT AND TOSS OF DEBRIS FROM ROADWAY

Appropriate Rubber Tire Equipment and Supervisor with vehicle (including operators)

TOTAL

RESPONSE DEADLINE: May 13, 2024 at 10:00 a.m.

Ceres
Environmental
Services, Inc.

$315.00

CTC Disaster
Response, Inc.

Unit Cost

$335.00

DRC Emergency
Services, LLC

Unit Cost

$395.00

Looks Great Services
of MS, Inc.

Unit Cost

$275.00

Phillips & Jordan,
Inc.

Unit Cost 1 Unit Cost

$350.00

Property Services
GC

$395.00

Southern Disaster | T.F.R. Enterprises, |

Recovery, LLC

$357.00

Unit Cost

$375.00

The Middlesex
Corporation

Unit Cost

$1,044.00

$315.00
Ceres

$335.00

$395.00

$275.00

$350.00

$395.00

$357.00

$375.00

$1,044.00

GROUP II - COLLECTION, HAULING TO STAGING SITE AND REDUCTION Environmental CTC Disaster DRC Emergency | Loaks Great Services | Phillips & Jordan, | Property Services | Southern Disaster | T.F.R. Enterprises, | The Middlesex
Services, Inc Response, Inc Services, LLC of MS, Inc. Inc. GC Recovery, LLC Corporation
Description Unit Cost Unit Cast Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

2 Loading and Hauling Vegetative Debris (Price to include MOT) $9.98 $6.90 $7.42 $7.75 $8.25 $11.00 $7.75 $7.65 No Bid
Debris Management Site (DMS) Management (to include preparation; management;

3 segregating at site and restoration of Department supplied site) $.50 5.60 $1.32 $1.50 $1.00 $2.00 $1.00 $2.00 No Bid
Debris Management Site [DMS) (provided hy the Contractor after 7 days
Notice to Proceed]

4 $15,000.00 $1.00 $7,500.00 $5,000.00 $12,500.00 $33,000.00 $8,000.00 $25,000.00 No Bid

5 Reduction of Vegetative Debris - Grinding $1.90 $3.10 $3.68 $3.50 $2.95 $3.00 $3.25 61.85 No Bid

6 Reduction of Vegetative Debris - Air Curtain Incineration §1.75 $1.90 $2.48 $2.50 52.25 $3.00 $2.90 $1.50 No Bid

7 Reduction of Vegetative Debris - Open Burning §1.50 $1.35 $1.98 $1.25 52.00 §2.50 $1.95 $1.00 No Bid

8 Reduction of Vegetative Debris - Compacting $1.50 5.01 5.50 $1.00 $2.25 $3.00 $.60 $1.50 No Bid
Stump Removal (24"-48")

9 (Price to include removal, disposal and backfilling costs) $100.00 $50.00 $200.00 $385.00 $350.00 $450.00 $197.50 $375.00 No Bid
Stump Removal (> 48")

10 (Price to include removal, disposal and backfilling costs) $150.00 $100.00 $300.00 $550.00 $425.00 $600.00 $264.00 $525.00 No Bid
Removal of eligible hanging Limbs > 2"

11 (Price to include cost of disposal) $150.00 $98.00 $89.50 585.00 $175.00 §200.00 $89.00 $110.00 Mo Bid
Removal of Leaning Trees > 6" @ 4.5' above the ground

12 (Price to include cost of disposal) - 6" - < 12" $25.00 $88.00 $150.00 $70.00 $245.00 $450.00 $135.00 $185.00 No Bid
Removal of Leaning Trees > 6" @ 4.5' above the ground

13 (Price to include cost of disposal) - 12" - < 24" $85.00 $188.00 $295.00 $165.00 $325.00 $650.00 $225.00 $285.00 No Bid
Removal of Leaning Trees > 6" @ 4.5’ above the ground

14 (Price to include cost of disposal) - 24" - < 36" $125.00 $288.00 $425.00 $235.00 $425.00 $750.00 $330.00 $385.00 No Bid
Removal of Leaning Trees > 6" @ 4.5' above the ground

15 (Price to include cost of disposal) - > 36" $235.00 $328.00 $550.00 $315.00 $545.00 $850.00 $490.00 $650.00 No Bid

16 Loading and Hauling C&D Debris to a DMS (Price to include MOT) $9.98 $7.90 57.68 $7.75 $8.25 $15.00 $8.25 $8.75 No Bid

17 Loading and Hauling C&D Debris to a final disposal site (Price to include MOT) $9.98 $8.90 57.98 $8.50 $9.95 $15.00 $9.75 $9.25 No Bid

18 Loading and Hauling C&D Debris to a final disposal site (Price to include MOT) $2.90 $5.90 $4.42 $4.50 $5.45 $15.00 $6.90 $5.50 No Bid

19 Sweeping Curb and Gutter $280.00 $200.00 $550.00 $275.00 $295.00 $800.00 $325.00 $1,275.00 No Bid

20 Vacuum Inlets $430.00 $495.00 $300.00 $250.00 $395.00 $500.00 §295.00 $550.00 No Bid

21 White Goods Hauling and Final Recycling / Disposal » $65.00 $45.00 $40.00 $50.00 $75.00 $175.00 547.00 $45.00 No Bid

22 White Goods Hauling and Final Recycling / Disposal $35.00 $40.00 §20.00 $15.00 $25.00 $100.00 $35.00 $45.00 No Bid

23 White Goods Hauling and Final Recycling / Disposal $65.00 $45.00 540.00 $50.00 $75.00 $175.00 $47.00 $45.00 No Bid
Removal and Disposal of oxygen depleting Frean/refrigerants; mercury or compressor

24 oils from White Good $65.00 545,00 525.00 §15.00 $30.00 $100.00 $45.00 $45.00 No Bid

25 Hazardous Household Waste (HHW) removal and disposal 59.98 $6.00 $12.95 $7.00 5$8.00 $12.00 $3.80 $10.00 No Bid

26 Hazardous Household Waste (HHW) removal and disposal $9.98 $5.00 $9.95 $5.00 $3.00 512.00 $2.50 $10.00 No Bid

27 Removal of Electronic Waste $28.00 $30.00 $20.00 $15.00 545,00 $30.00 $37.00 §20.00 No Bid
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: EVALUATION TABULATION

ITB NO. 24-TF00708/AP - DISASTER AND DEBRIS REMOVAL SERVICES
e RESPONSE DEADLINE: May 13, 2024 at 10:00 a.m.
Ceres

GROUP |1 - COLLECTION, HAULING TO STAGING SITE AND REDUCTION (Continued) Environmental CTC Disaster DRC Emergency | Looks Great Services | Phillips & Jordan, | Property Services | Southern Disaster | T.F.R. Enterprises, | The Middlesex
Services, Response, Inc. Services, LLC of MS, Inc. Recovery, LLC Corporation

LTS
i

Description Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

Removal of trailers and vehicles

28 (Price to include handling, hauling, storage and disposal) $100.00 $200.00 $395.00 $150.00 $425.00 5400.00 $590.00 $250.00 No Bid
Removal of Vessels < 30 feet

29 (Price to include handling, hauling, storage and disposal) 5198.00 545.00 $110.00 $15.00 $95.00 $150.00 5143.00 $20.00 No Bid
Removal of Vessels > 30 feet

30 (Price to include handling, hauling, storage and disposal) $598.00 $75.00 5140.00 $25.00 $250.00 $200.00 $195.00 $26.00 No Bid
Removal of Putrescent Debris, debris that will decompose or rot

31 (animal carcasses and organic fleshy matter) $4.98 $5.00 $9.50 $2.50 $12.00 $15.00 $2.50 $5.00 No Bid

32 Loading and Hauling Sand, Soil, Silt and Sediment $10.54 $14.00 $12.98 $17.00 $16.00 $16.00 $14.00 $6.00 No Bid

33 Loading and Hauling Sand, Sail, Silt and Sediment $8.00 $12.00 $8.98 $14.00 $12.00 $16.00 $12.00 $4.75 No Bid

TOTAL $17,817.47 $2,439.56 $11,241,32 $7,748.75 $16,793.35 $39,720.50 $11,566,75 $29,910.75

Ceres

GROUP Il - LOADING OF REDUCED MATERIAL AND FINAL DISPOSAL Environmental CTC Disaster DRC Emergency | Looks Great Services | Phillips & Jordan, | Property Services | Southern Disaster | T.F.R. Enterprises, | The Middlesex

Services, Inc. Response, Inc, Services, LLC of MS, Inc. Inc. GC

_ Ine Recovery, LLC A Carporation
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
e Item

Loading and Hauling Reduced Debris for Vegetative and C&D Only
34 (Price to include MOT) $2.90 $4.45 $4.62

$3.50 $5.50 $15.00 56.90 $5.00 No Bid
35 Disposal/Tipping Fees $0.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL $2.90 $4.45 $4.62 $3.50 $5.50 $15.00 $6.90 $5.00 No Bid
Ceres |
GROUP V - REQUIRED SERVICES Environmental CTC Disaster DRC Emergency | Looks Great Services | Phillips & Jordan, | Property Services | Southern Disaster | T.F.R. Enterprises, | The Middlesex
Services, Inc. Response, Inc. Services, LLC of MS, Inc, Recovery, LLC Corporation
Description Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Storm Sewer, Culvert and/or Catch Basin Cleaning §21.59 $28.00 $23.50 $15.00 $34.00 §28.00 $33.00 $15.00 No Bid
102 Debris Removal and Restoration of Retention Ponds, Lakes and/or Waterways/Canals $24.98 $12.00 $68.50 $10.00 $48.00 $80.00 549,00 $23.50 No Bid
103 White Goods, as specified $75.00 $45.00 $40.00 $25.00 $75.00 $100.00 $52.00 $45.00 No Bid
104 Freon Recovery, as specified $75.00 $45.00 $25.00 $40.00 $30.00 $65.00 $45.00 $65.00 No Bid
105 Dead Animal Removal and Disposal $2.98 $4.00 51.00 §2.50 $6.00 57.50 52.50 $2.00 No Bid
106 Motor Vehicle Removal and Disposal - PASSENGER §225.00 $175.00 $395.00 $250.00 $395.00 $400.00 $320.00 $250.00 No Bid
107 Motor Vehicle Removal and Disposal - COMMERCIAL $250.00 $295.00 5495.00 $500.00 $425.00 $550.00 $490.00 $400.00 No Bid
$674.55 $604.00 $1,048.00 $842.50 $1,013.00 $1,230.50 $991,50 $800.50
Ceres
GROUP VI - OPTIONAL SERVICES OF RED TIDE - CLEAN UP AND REMOVAL OF PUTRESCENT DEBRIS Environmental CTC Disaster DRC Emergency | Looks Great Services | Phillips & Jordan, | Property Services | Southern Disaster | T.F.R. Enterprises, | The Middlesex

Services, Inc. Response, Inc. Services, LLC of MS, Inc. Inc. GC ﬁg:_overy, LLC _Inc. chporation_
-- Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Line Item
108 DRC Operations Manager $115.00 $85.00 $105.00 $80.00 No Bid $80.00 No Bid
109 DRC Superintendent $70.00 $100.00 $75.00 $90.00 $70.00 No Bid No Bid $70.00 No Bid
110 Supervisor with Vehicle $70.00 $85.00 $65.00 $95.00 $70.00 No Bid MNo Bid $65.00 No Bid
111 Captain $70.00 $115.00 $150.00 $150.00 $125.00 No Bid No Bid $145.00 No Bid
112 Deck Hand $65.00 $75.00 $110.00 $100.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid
113 Marine Operator $75.00 $95.00 $175.00 $110.00 $85.00 No Bid No Bid $165.00 No Bid
114 Admin Assistant $45.00 $55.00 $35.00 $60.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid
115 Heavy Equipment Operator $70.00 $75.00 $65.00 S65.00 $70.00 No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid
116 Tool Operator $50.00 $75.00 $65.00 $60.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid
117 Laborer $50.00 $70.00 $65.00 $55.00 $65.00 No Bid Mo Bid $50.00 No Bid
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PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT

GROUP VI - OPTIONAL SERVICES OF RED TIDE - CLEAN UP AND REMOVAL OF PUTRESCENT DEBRIS
(Continued)

Description
118 Hazmat Worker
119 Mechanic with Truck and Tools
120 <14' Work Boat
121 >14" Work Boat
122 Skimmer Boat
123 Beach Rake with Tractor
124 Boom
125 Barge 12 x 40
126 Roll Off Dumpsters

127 Roll Off Truck

GROUP IV - OPTIONAL LOGISTICS AND PLANNING SERVICES

T e ta Description
36 Hand Operated Transfer Pump (hourly rate)
37 Hand Operated Transfer Pump (daily rate)
38 1" Diaphragm Pump
39 1" Diaphragm Pump
40 2" Diaphragm Pump
41 2" Diaphragm Pump
42 2" Diaphragm Pump S.5.

43 2" Diaphragm Pump S.5.

44 3" Diaphragm Pump

45 3" Diaphragm Pump

46 6" Diaphragm Pump

47 6" Diaphragm Pump

48 1” Suction or Discharge Hose

49 1" Suction or Discharge Hose

50 2" Suction or Discharge Hose

51 2" Suction or Discharge Hose

52 3" Suction or Discharge Hose

53 3" Suction or Discharge Hose

54 6" Suction or Discharge Hose

55 6" Suction or Discharge Hose

56 2" Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose
57 2" Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose
58 3" Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose
59 3" Chermical Suction or Discharge Hose
60 6" Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose
61 6" Chemical Suction or Discharge Hose
62 185 CFM Compressor

63 185 CFM Compressor

64 Air-hose Section, 50 feet

65 Air-hose Section, 50 feet

66 Portable Lighting trailer

67 Portable Lighting trailer

EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB NO. 24-TFO0708/AP - DISASTER AND DEBRIS REMOVAL SERVICES
RESPONSE DEADLINE: May 13, 2024 at 10:00 a.m.

Ceres

Environmental CTC Disaster DRC Emergency | Looks Great Services | Phillips & Jordan, | Property Services | Southern Disaster | T.F.R. Enterprises, | The Middlesex

Services, Inc, Response, Inc. Services, LLC of MS, Inc. Inc. GC Recovery, LLC Corporation

Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$65.00 $75.00 $95.00 $80.00 $75.00 No Bid No Bid $90.00 No Bid
$55.00 $120.00 $150.00 $135.00 $95,00 No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid
$850.00 $150.00 2,750.00 $850.00 $550.00 No Bid No Bid $2,000.00 No Bid
$850.00 $300.00 $3,950.00 $1,500.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 Mo Bid
$114.40 $250.00 $450.00 $115.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid $150.00 No Bid
$75.98 $115.00 $125.00 $115.00 $175.00 No Bid No Bid $160.00 No Bid
$66.71 $6.00 $2.00 No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid 52.25 No Bid
$221.65 $300.00 $75.00 $400.00 $1,250.00 No Bid No Bid $325.00 No Bid
5116.24 $375.00 $550.00 $200.00 $450.00 No Bid No Bid $75.00 No Bid
$105.00 $1,125.00 $550.00 $200.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid 51,350.00 No Bid

TOTAL

$3,259.98
Ceres
Environmental
Services, Inc.

Unit Cost

$13.00
$105.00
$25.00
$200.00
$29.00
$232.00
542.00
$336.00
$41.00
$328.00
$97.00
$776.00
$8.00
$40.00
$10.00
$50.00
$10.50
652.50
$12.00
$60.00
510.50
$52.50
$10.70
$53.50
$12.50
$62.50
$26.00
$156.00
$3.00
515.00
$36.00
$216.00

$3,676.00

$9,587.00

CTC Disaster DRC Emergency
Response, Inc. Services, LLC

Unit Cost

$5.00
$50.00
$10.00
$100.00
$15.00
$150.00
$25.00
$250.00
$25.00
$250,00
$50.00
$500.00
$4.00
$40.00
$6.00
$60.00
58.00
$80.00
$13.00
$130.00
$13.00
$130.00
$17.00
$170.00
$55.00
$550.00
$13.00
$130.00
$5.00
$50.00
$25.00
$250,00

Unit Cost

$50.00
$500.00
$65.00
$650.00
$95.00
$950.00
$125.00
$1,250.00
$155.00
$1,550.00
$295.00
$2,950.00
$20.00
$200.00
$25.00
$250.00
530.00
$300.00
$35.00
$350.00
No Bid
$1,250.00
No Bid
$1,250.00
No Bid
$3,500.00
No Bid
$950.00
No Bid
$25.00
$25.00
$250.00
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$4,485.00

Looks Great Services
of MS, Inc.

Unit Cost

$15.00
$150.00
$5.00
$50.00
$7.00
$70.00
$8.00
$80.00
$10.00
$100.00
$14.00
$140.00
$1.00
$10.00
$2.00
$20.00
$3.00
$30.00
$6.00
$60.00
$3.00
$30.00
$5.00
$50.00
$8.00
$80.00
$25.00
$250.00
52.50
525.00
$12.50
$125.00

$5,355.00

Phillips & Jordan,
Inc.

Unit Cost

$25.00
$250.00
$25.00
$250.00
$30.00
$300.00
$35.00
$350.00
$45.00
$450.00
560.00
$600.00
$5.00
$50.00
$7.00
$70.00
$12.00
$120.00
$20.00
$200.00
$8.00
$80.00
$10.00
$100.00
$35.00
$350.00
$30.00
$300.00
$8.00
$80.00
$20.00
$200.00

No Bid

Property Services
GC

Unit Cost

No Bid
$1,400.00
No Bid
$600.00
No Bid
$1,400.00
No Bid
$2,000.00
No Bid
$2,800.00
No Bid
$3,300.00
No Bid
$50.00
No Bid
$75.00
No Bid
$100.00
No Bid
$200.00
No Bid
$75.00
No Bid
$125.00
No Bid
$250.00
No Bid
$500.00
Na Bid
$10.00
No Bid
$600.00

No Bid

$7,522.25

Southern Disaster | T.F.R. Enterprises,

s Recovery, LLC

Unit Cost

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Inc.
Unit Cost

$50.00
$400.00
520.00
$150.00
$90.00
$700.00
$150.00
$1,200.00
$250.00
$2,000.00
$375.00
$3,000.00
$10.00
$80.00
$10.50
$85.00
$12.00
$90.00
$15.00
$120.00
$13.00
$100.00
$17.00
$130.00
$25.00
$200.00
$19.00
$145.00
$10.00
$75.00
$45.00
$360.00

No Bid

The Middlesex
Corparation

Unit Cost

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Na Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Mo Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid



EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB NO. 24-TFOO708/AP - DISASTER AND DEBRIS REMOVAL SERVICES
e S RESPONSE DEADLINE: May 13, 2024 at 10:00 a.m.

Ceres
GROUP IV - OPTIONAL LOGISTICS AND PLANNING SERVICES - Continued Environmental CTC Disaster DRC Emergency | Looks Great Services | Phillips & Jordan, | Property Services | Southern Disaster | T.F.R. Enterprises, | The Middlesex
Services, Inc, Response, Inc. Services, LLC & of MS, Inc. Inc. GC Recovery, LLC . Corporation

scription it Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

Diesel Powered Generator, 60kw - 80kw, 3 phase, 240/480 valt, trailer mounted,

68 including 50' of cabling w/plug 5327.54 $140.00 $250.00 $40.00 $400.00 No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid
Diesel Powered Generator, 60kw - 80kw, 3 phase, 240/480 volt, trailer mounted,

69 including 50’ of cabling w/plug $1,544.00 $1,400.00 $250.00 $400.00 54,000.00 $1,800.00 No Bid $85.00 No Bid
70 Electrical Cable Section (50') 52.00 $3.00 No Bid $2.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid
71 Electrical Cable Section (50°) $10.00 $30.00 $50.00 $20.00 $150.00 $250.00 No Bid $75.00 No Bid
72 HEPA Vac 545.00 $45.00 No Bid 54.00 $30.00 No Bid No Bid §12.00 No Bid
73 HEPA Vac $360.00 $450.00 $350.00 540,00 $300.00 $75.00 No Bid §75.00 No Bid
74 Traffic Control Vest, Cones, Flags, Barrels, etc. $23.00 $25.00 No Bid $150.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid $40.00 No Bid
75 Traffic Control Vest, Cones, Flags, Barrels, etc. $184.00 $250.00 $250.00 $1,500.00 $150.00 $40.00 No Bid £250.00 Neo Bid
76 Extension Ladder, 28’ - 35 $9.00 $5.00 No Bid $1.00 $5.00 No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid
17 Extension Ladder, 28" - 35° $27.00 $50.00 $175.00 $10.00 $50.00 $80.00 No Bid $45.00 Mo Bid
78 Photographic Equipment $14.00 $15.00 No Bid $3.50 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid
19 Photographic Equipment $112.00 $150.00 $150.00 $35.00 $200.00 $200.00 No Bid $70.00 No Bid
80 Portable Toilet $14.00 55.00 No Bid $8.00 §5.00 No Bid No Bid 515.00 No Bid
81 Portable Toilet $112.00 $50.00 $95.00 $80.00 $50.00 $175.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid
82 Mechanized Broom $15.34 $85.00 $75.00 $8.50 $50.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 No Bid
83 Mechanized Broom $153.40 $850.00 $750.00 $85.00 $300.00 $1,400.00 No Bid $880.00 No Bid
84 4 mil 20X100 Polyethylene 52048 $5.00 No Bid $8.00 $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
85 4 mil 20X100 Polyethylene $102.38 $50.00 $200.00 $80.00 $100.00 $350.00 No Bid $10.00 No Bid
86 6 mil 20X100 Polyethylene $32.40 $6.00 No Bid $12.00 $5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
87 6 mil 20X100 Polyethylene $162.00 $60.00 $200.00 $120.00 $50,00 $400.00 No Bid $50.00 No Bid
88 & mil Bags 59.00 $7.00 No Bid §.25 $2.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
89 & mil Bags $36.00 $70.00 58.00 $2.50 $20.00 $80.00 No Bid $45.00 No Bid
90 55 — Gallon Drum, CEP-SDSSTHNEW, or equal $16.63 $10.00 No Bid $2.00 $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
91 55 = Gallon Drum, CEP-SDS5THNEW, or equal $83.13 $100.00 $150.00 $20.00 $200.00 $120.00 No Bid $130.00 No Bid
92 55 = Gallen Drum Liners, 10 mil $4.00 $5.00 No Bid $3.00 $2.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
93 55 — Gallon Drum Liners, 10 mil $20.00 $50.00 $10.00 $30.00 $10.00 $100.00 No Bid $40.00 No Bid
94 Fiber Drums, CEP-FIB30L, or equal $25.03 $5.00 No Bid $3.50 $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
a5 Fiber Drums, CEP-FIB30L, or equal $125.13 $50.00 $125.00 $35.00 $150.00 $175.00 No Bid $150.00 No Bid
96 30 Gallon Over-pack, CEP-1230YE, or equal $60.38 56.00 No Bid $2.00 $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
97 30 Gallon Over-pack, CEP-1230YE, or equal $422.63 $60.00 $400.00 $20.00 $200.00 $250.00 No Bid $70.00 No Bid
98 95 Gallon Poly Over-pack, CEP1237YE, or equal $66.41 $10.00 No Bid $4.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
99 95 Gallon Poly Over-pack, CEP1237YE, or equal $464.89 $100.00 $900.00 $40.00 $400.00 $300.00 No Bid $200.00 No Bid
100 Caution/Hazard Tape (per roll) 59.00 $15.00 $30.00 $5.00 $20.00 $18.00 No Bid $25.00 No Bid

TOTAL $7,732.97 $7,341.00 $21,513.00 $4,171.25 $11,129.00 $19,298.00 No Bid $12,458.50 No Bid

001%:{ W 5/;9/94

Cathy Tefftlfrocureinent Manager
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