County of Hernando

Procurement Department

Carla Rossiter-Smith, Chief Procurement Officer
15470 Flight Path Drive, Brooksville, FL 34604

EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB No. 24-CG00873/JC

Hayman Rd from Twister Ln to Deepwell Dr Safety Upgrades SCOP 449053-1-54-01 (Rebid)
RESPONSE DEADLINE: October 21, 2024 at 10:00 am

SELECTED VENDOR TOTALS
Vendor Option 1 Option 2
DB Civil Construction, LLC $1,119,000.00 No Bid
Ajax Paving Industries of Florida, LLC $2,164,764.00 No Bid

Cathcart Construction Company - Florida, LLC $2,776,109.70 $2,792,603.70




EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB No. 24-CG00873/JC
Hayman Rd from Twister Ln to Deepwell Dr Safety Upgrades SCOP 449053-1-54-01 (Rebid)

OPTION 1 - TRADITIONAL CONSTRUCTION METHOD

OPTION 1 - TRADITIONAL CONSTRUCTION METHOD Ajax Paving Industries of Florida, = Cathcart Construction Company - DB Civil Construction, LLC
Florida, LLC

Selected  Line Item Description Quantity | Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost

X 1 MOBILIZATION, 1 LS $295,000.00 $295,000.00 $195,000.00 $195,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00

DEMOBILIZATION, SPECIAL

PROVISIONS, NPDES N.O.1.
and NPDES N.O.T.

X 2 MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC 1 LS $372,000.00 $372,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
X 3 WORK ZONE SIGN 1 LS $1.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
X 4 CHANNELIZING DEVICE- TYPES 1 LS $1.00 $1.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

I, 11, DI, VP, DRUM, OR LCD

X 5 CLEARING and GRUBBING 1 LS $123,000.00 $123,000.00 $305,000.00 $305,000.00 $61,000.00 $61,000.00
(Includes Mailbox Relocates,
Saw- cutting, Milling Butt-
Joints, Asphalt Removal,
Concrete Removal, Windrow
Removal, Sign Removal and
Relocates)

X 6 BORROW EXCAVATION - 12 cY $305.00 $3,660.00 $35.00 $420.00 $60.00 $720.00
CLEAN IMPORT FILL MATERIAL
(Truck Ticket Measure) (Field
Determined where needed for
shoulder drop-offs)

X 7 SILT FENCE 2000 LF $2.00 $4,000.00 $4.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $2,000.00
X 8 24" FDOT RCP 8 LF $1,150.00 $9,200.00 $600.00 $4,800.00 $250.00 $2,000.00
X 9 24" FDOT ENDWALL 1 EA $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
X 10 FDOT CONCRETE COLLAR 1 EA $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

(3000 PSI w/ Fibermesh)
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EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB No. 24-CG00873/JC
Hayman Rd from Twister Ln to Deepwell Dr Safety Upgrades SCOP 449053-1-54-01 (Rebid)

OPTION 1 - TRADITIONAL CONSTRUCTION METHOD

Ajax Paving Industries of Florida,

Cathcart Construction Company -

DB Civil Construction, LLC

Florida, LLC
Selected  Line ltem Description Quantity | Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
X 11 12" TYP "B" STABILIZATION, 7898 SY $21.00 $165,858.00 $68.00 $537,064.00 $18.00 $142,164.00
LBR 40
X 12 4" LIMEROCK BASE, LBR 100 734 TN $130.00 $95,420.00 $290.00 $212,860.00 $75.00 $55,050.00
X 13 7" LIMEROCK BASE, LBR 886 TN $120.00 $106,320.00 $290.00 $256,940.00 $75.00 $66,450.00
X 14 EXCAVATION (Road Widening 486 CcY $150.00 $72,900.00 $55.00 $26,730.00 $40.00 $19,440.00
& Paved Shoulder)
X 15 1-1/4" MILLINGS (Delivered to 8698 SY $4.00 $34,792.00 $9.00 $78,282.00 $6.00 $52,188.00
H.C. Cobb Rd Site)
X 16 1.5" SP12.5 ASPHALT (Traffic 786 TN $300.00 $235,800.00 $315.00 $247,590.00 $200.00 $157,200.00
neny
X 17 1" SP9.5 ASPHALT OVERLAY 886 TN $210.00 $186,060.00 $305.00 $270,230.00 $180.00 $159,480.00
(Traffic "C")(w/ Safety Edge)
X 18 SWALE REGRADING 1 LS $64,000.00 $64,000.00 $64,000.00 $64,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00
X 19 PERFORMANCE TURF, SOD, 29000 SY $7.00 $203,000.00 $6.00 $174,000.00 $3.50 $101,500.00
BAHIA
X 20 FDOT SIGN ASSEMBLIES 41 EA $690.00 $28,290.00 $650.00 $26,650.00 $600.00 $24,600.00
X 21 4" TEMPORARY PAINT, SOLID 8704 LF $1.00 $8,704.00 $0.75 $6,528.00 $0.50 $4,352.00
STRIPE, WHITE
X 22 6" THERMOPLASTIC, SOLID 4325 LF $1.00 $4,325.00 $1.40 $6,055.00 $1.00 $4,325.00
STRIPE, WHITE
X 23 4" TEMPORARY PAINT, DBL. 8704 LF $1.00 $8,704.00 $1.30 $11,315.20 $1.00 $8,704.00
SOLID STRIPE, YELLOW
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EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB No. 24-CG00873/JC
Hayman Rd from Twister Ln to Deepwell Dr Safety Upgrades SCOP 449053-1-54-01 (Rebid)

OPTION 1 - TRADITIONAL CONSTRUCTION METHOD Ajax Paving Industries of Florida, | Cathcart Construction Company - DB Civil Construction, LLC
Florida, LLC

Selected  Line ltem Description Quantity | Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost

X 24 6" THERMOPLASTIC, DBL. 4325 LF $3.00 $12,975.00 $2.50 $10,812.50 $2.00 $8,650.00
SOLID STRIPE, YELLOW

X 25 4" TEMPORARY PAINT, SOLID 8704 LF $1.00 $8,704.00 $0.75 $6,528.00 $0.50 $4,352.00
STRIPE, YELLOW

X 26 6" THERMOPLASTIC, SOLID 4325 LF $1.00 $4,325.00 $1.40 $6,055.00 $1.00 $4,325.00
STRIPE, YELLOW

X 27 RPM'S 125 EA $9.00 $1,125.00 $6.00 $750.00 $8.00 $1,000.00

X 28 GOPHER TORTOISE 1 LS $7,100.00 $7,100.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00
PERMITTING & MAPPING

X 29 GOPHER TORTOISE BURROWS 5 EA $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $700.00 $3,500.00
EXCAVATIONS

X 30 GOPHER TORTOISE 5 EA $8,000.00 $40,000.00 $9,000.00 $45,000.00 $6,000.00 $30,000.00
RELOCATIONS

X 31 ELECTRONIC ASBUILT SURVEY 1 LS $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

(S&S by FL. REG. P.L.S.)

Total $2,164,764.00 $2,776,109.70 $1,119,000.00
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EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB No. 24-CG00873/JC
Hayman Rd from Twister Ln to Deepwell Dr Safety Upgrades SCOP 449053-1-54-01 (Rebid)

OPTION 2 - FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION CONSTRUCTION METHOD

OPTION 2 - FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION CONSTRUCTION METHOD

Ajax Paving Industries of Florida,

Cathcart Construction Company -

DB Civil Construction, LLC

Florida, LLC
Selected  Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Total
X 1 MOBILIZATION, 1 LS No Bid No Bid $195,000.00 $195,000.00 No Bid No Bid
DEMOBILIZATION, SPECIAL
PROVISIONS, NPDES N.O.1.
and NPDES N.O.T.
X 2 MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC 1 LS No Bid No Bid $160,000.00 | $160,000.00 No Bid No Bid
X 3 WORK ZONE SIGN 1 LS No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid
X 4 CHANNELIZING DEVICE- TYPES 1 LS No Bid No Bid $17,500.00 $17,500.00 No Bid No Bid
I, 11, DI, VP, DRUM, OR LCD
X 5 CLEARING and GRUBBING 1 LS No Bid No Bid $305,000.00 $305,000.00 No Bid No Bid
(Includes Mailbox Relocates,
Saw- cutting, Milling Butt-
Joints, Asphalt Removal,
Concrete Removal, Windrow
Removal, Sign Removal and
Relocates)
X 6 BORROW EXCAVATION - 12 cy No Bid No Bid $35.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid
CLEAN IMPORT FILL MATERIAL
(Truck Ticket Measure) (Field
Determined where needed for
shoulder drop-offs)
X 7 SILT FENCE 2000 LF No Bid No Bid $4.00 $8,000.00 No Bid No Bid
X 8 24" FDOT RCP 8 LF No Bid No Bid $600.00 $4,800.00 No Bid No Bid
X 9 24" FDOT ENDWALL 1 EA No Bid No Bid $9,500.00 $9,500.00 No Bid No Bid
X 10 FDOT CONCRETE COLLAR 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4,000.00 $4,000.00 No Bid No Bid
(3000 PSI w/ Fibermesh)
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EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB No. 24-CG00873/JC
Hayman Rd from Twister Ln to Deepwell Dr Safety Upgrades SCOP 449053-1-54-01 (Rebid)

OPTION 2 - FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION CONSTRUCTION METHOD

Ajax Paving Industries of Florida,

Cathcart Construction Company -

DB Civil Construction, LLC

Florida, LLC

Selected  Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Total

X 11 FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION 7898 SY No Bid No Bid $80.00 $631,840.00 No Bid No Bid

X 12 4" LIMEROCK BASE, LBR 100 734 TN No Bid No Bid $290.00 $212,860.00 No Bid No Bid

X 13 7" LIMEROCK BASE, LBR 886 TN No Bid No Bid $290.00 $256,940.00 No Bid No Bid

X 14 EXCAVATION (Road Widening 486 cy No Bid No Bid $55.00 $26,730.00 No Bid No Bid

& Paved Shoulder)
X 15 1.5" SP12.5 ASPHALT (Traffic 786 TN No Bid No Bid $315.00 $247,590.00 No Bid No Bid
nen
X 16 1" SP9.5 ASPHALT OVERLAY 886 TN No Bid No Bid $305.00 $270,230.00 No Bid No Bid
(Traffic "C")(w/ Safety Edge)
X 17 SWALE REGRADING 1 LS No Bid No Bid $64,000.00 $64,000.00 No Bid No Bid
X 18 PERFORMANCE TURF, SOD, 29000 SY No Bid No Bid $6.00 $174,000.00 No Bid No Bid
BAHIA

X 19 FDOT SIGN ASSEMBLIES 41 EA No Bid No Bid $650.00 $26,650.00 No Bid No Bid

X 20 4" TEMPORARY PAINT, SOLID 8704 LF No Bid No Bid $0.75 $6,528.00 No Bid No Bid
STRIPE, WHITE

X 21 6" THERMOPLASTIC, SOLID 4325 LF No Bid No Bid $1.40 $6,055.00 No Bid No Bid
STRIPE, WHITE

X 22 4" TEMPORARY PAINT, DBL. 8704 LF No Bid No Bid $1.30 $11,315.20 No Bid No Bid

SOLID STRIPE, YELLOW
X 23 6" THERMOPLASTIC, DBL. 4325 LF No Bid No Bid $2.50 $10,812.50 No Bid No Bid
SOLID STRIPE, YELLOW

X 24 4" TEMPORARY PAINT, SOLID 8704 LF No Bid No Bid $0.75 $6,528.00 No Bid No Bid

STRIPE, YELLOW
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EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB No. 24-CG00873/JC
Hayman Rd from Twister Ln to Deepwell Dr Safety Upgrades SCOP 449053-1-54-01 (Rebid)

OPTION 2 - FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION CONSTRUCTION METHOD Ajax Paving Industries of Florida, = Cathcart Construction Company - DB Civil Construction, LLC
Florida, LLC

Selected  Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost \ Total

X 25 6" THERMOPLASTIC, SOLID 4325 LF No Bid No Bid $1.40 $6,055.00 No Bid No Bid
STRIPE, YELLOW

X 26 RPM'S 125 EA No Bid No Bid $6.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid

X 27 GOPHER TORTOISE 1 LS No Bid No Bid $4,500.00 $4,500.00 No Bid No Bid
PERMITTING & MAPPING

X 28 GOPHER TORTOISE BURROWS 5 EA No Bid No Bid $2,000.00 $10,000.00 No Bid No Bid
EXCAVATIONS

X 29 GOPHER TORTOISE 5 EA No Bid No Bid $9,000.00 $45,000.00 No Bid No Bid
RELOCATIONS

X 30 ELECTRONIC ASBUILT SURVEY 1 LS No Bid No Bid $55,000.00 $55,000.00 No Bid No Bid

(S&S by FL. REG. P.L.S.)

Total No Bid $2,792,603.70 No Bid

Abaa Fke

Alisa Pike, Procurement Coordinator
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